Arizona Administrative

._ ;[?

‘4_?‘ .k_:m "% Lnt =
- Published: by, partment of State!~
s e Sy = ST ey || i, o e oo VL
Vol. 21, Issue 48 ~ Administrative Register Contents ~ November 27, 2015
) o .4 P 14 o T 2968
Rulemaking Guide .. ... .. e it et et it e e 2969
RULES AND RULEMAKING
Final Rulemaking, Notices of
4 AA.C. 11 State Board of Dental EXaminers . . . .. ... ... 2971
4 A.A.C. 36 Department of Fire, Building and Life Safety . ........ ... ... .. . . i 2973
Final Exempt Rulemaking, Notices of
21 A.A.C. 5 Department of Child Safety - Permanency and Support Services . . ...... ... ... ... .. ..., 2979
OTHER AGENCY NOTICES
Docket Opening, Notices of Rulemaking
4 A.A.C. 39 Board for Private Postsecondary Education. .. ... .. . . 2983
Proposed Delegation Agreement, Notices of
Department of Environmental Quality . .. ... ... 2984
Substantive Policy Statement, Notices of Agency
Department Of INSUIaNCe . . . . ... o e e 2986
Ombudsman, Notices of Agency
Arizona State Lottery . . . ... 2987
GOVERNOR'’S OFFICE
Governor’s Executive Orders
E.O. 2015-07: Authorization to Arm Designated Members of the Arizona National Guard ... .................... 2988
E.O. 2015-08: The Governor’s Council on Child Safety and Family Empowerment .. .......................... 2989
E.O. 2015-10: The Workforce Arizona Council . ... ... ... e e e 2990
E.O. 2015-01: Internal Review of Administrative Rules; Moratorium to Promote Job Creation and
Customer-Service-Oriented AGENCIES . . . . . ..ottt 2991
Governor’s Proclamations
ThanKsgiving Day. . . . ..o e 2993
Victims’ Bill of Rights Day. . . ... ... e e 2994
INDEXES
Register INndex Ledger . . . ... 2995
Rulemaking Action, Cumulative Index for 2015 . . .. ... .. . 2996
Other Notices and Public Records, Cumulative Index for 2015. . . . ... ... . e 3003
CALENDAR/DEADLINES
Rules Effective Dates Calendar. . ... ... .. . e 3005
Register Publishing Deadlines . . . ... ... e 3007
GOVERNOR’S REGULATORY REVIEW COUNCIL
Governor's Regulatory Review Council Deadlines. . . .. ... .. .. i e e 3008
Notice of Action Taken at the November 3, 2015 Meeting. . . . . . ... e 3009

|
DIRECTOR PUBLISHER RULES MANAGING EDITOR
Public Services Division Secretary of State Arizona Administrative Register
Scott Cancelosi MICHELE REAGAN Rhonda Paschal



e/

{_ Information

_—

Arizona Administrative REGISTER

From the Publisher

ABOUT THIS PUBLICATION

The paper copy of the Administrative Register (A.A.R.) is the official
publication for rules and rulemaking activity in the state of Arizona.

Rulemaking is defined in Arizona Revised Statues known as the Arizona
Administrative Procedure Act (APA), A.R.S. Title 41, Chapter 6, Articles 1
through 10.

The Office of the Secretary of State does not interpret or enforce rules
published in the Arizona Administrative Register or Code. Questions should be
directed to the state agency responsible for the promulgation of the rule as
provided in its published filing.

The Register is cited by volume and page number. Volumes are published by
calendar year with issues published weekly. Page numbering continues in each
weekly issue.

In addition, the Register contains the full text of the Governor’s Executive
Orders and Proclamations of general applicability, summaries of Attorney
General opinions, notices of rules terminated by the agency, and the Governor’s
appointments of state officials and members of state boards and commissions.

ABOUT RULES

Rules can be: made (all new text); amended (rules on file, changing text);
repealed (removing text); or renumbered (moving rules to a different Section
number). Rules activity published in the Register includes: proposed, final,
emergency, expedited, and exempt rules as defined in the APA.

Rulemakings initiated under the APA as effective on and after January 1,
1995, include the full text of the rule in the Register. New rules in this publication
(whether proposed or made) are denoted with underlining; repealed text is
stricken.

WHERE IS A “CLEAN” COPY OF THE FINAL OR EXEMPT
RULE PUBLISHED IN THE REGISTER?

The Arizona Administrative Code (A.A.C) contains the codified text of rules.
The A.A.C. contains rules promulgated and filed by state agencies that have been
approved by the Attorney General or the Governor’s Regulatory Review Council.
The Code also contains rules exempt from the rulemaking process.

The printed Code is the official publication of a rule in the A.A.C. is prima
facie evidence of the making, amendment, or repeal of that rule as provided by
AR.S. § 41-1012. Paper copies of rules are available by full Chapter or by
subscription. The Code is posted online for free.

LEGAL CITATIONS AND FILING NUMBERS

On the cover: Each agency is assigned a Chapter in the Arizona
Administrative Code under a specific Title. Titles represent broad subject areas.
The Title number is listed first; with the acronym A.A.C., which stands for the
Arizona Administrative Code; following the Chapter number and Agency name,
then program name. For example, the Secretary of State has rules on rulemaking
in Title 1, Chapter 1 of the Arizona Administrative Code. The citation for this
chapter is 1 A.A.C. 1, Secretary of State, Rules and Rulemaking

Every document filed in the office is assigned a file number. This number,
enclosed in brackets, is located at the top right of the published documents in the
Register. The original filed document is available for 10 cents a copy.

Arizona Administrative

Issue 48

PUBLISHER
SECRETARY OF STATE
Michele Reagan

PUBLIC SERVICES STAFF
DIRECTOR
Scott Cancelosi

RULES MANAGING EDITOR
Rhonda Paschal

PRINTING
Demetrius Russaw

SUBSCRIPTIONS
ADMINISTRATIVE REGISTER
The printed version of the

Administrative Register is the official
publication of Arizona
state agency rules.
Rates: $275 yearly
New subscriptions, renewals and
address changes contact customer
service at
(602) 364-3224.

This publication is available online for
free at www.azsos.gov.

ADMINISTRATIVE CODE
A price list for the Arizona
Administrative Code is available
online. You may also request a paper
price list by mail. To purchase a paper
Chapter, contact customer service at
(602) 364-3224.

PUBLICATION DEADLINES
Publication dates are published in the

back of the Register. These dates
include file submittal dates with a
three-week turnaround from filing to
published document.

CONTACT US
The Honorable Michele Reagan

Office of the Secretary of State
1700 W. Washington Street, FI. 7
Phoenix, AZ 85007
(602) 542-4285

The Office of the Secretary of State is
an equal opportunity employer.

2968

Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



Arizona Administrative REGISTER

Rulemaking Guide /,\Z

Participate
in the Process

Look for the Agency Notice

Review (inspect) notices published
in the Arizona Administrative Register.
Many agencies maintain stakeholder
lists and would be glad to inform you
when they proposed changes to rules.
Check an agency’s website and its
newsletters for news about notices and
meetings.

Feel like a change should be made
to a rule and an agency has not
proposed changes? You can petition
an agency to make, amend, or repeal a
rule. The agency must respond to the
petition. (See A.R.S. § 41-1033)

Attend a public hearing/meeting

Attend a public meeting that is
being conducted by the agency on a
Notice of Proposed Rulemaking.
Public meetings may be listed in the
Preamble of a Notice of Proposed
Rulemaking or they may be published
separately in the Register. Be prepared
to speak, attend the meeting, and make
an oral comment.

An agency may not have a public
meeting scheduled on the Notice of
Proposed Rulemaking. If not, you may
request that the agency schedule a
proceeding. This request must be put
in writing within 30 days after the
published Notice of Proposed
Rulemaking.

Write the agency

Put your comments in writing to
the agency. In order for the agency to
consider your comments, the agency
must receive them by the close of
record. The comment must be
received within the 30-day comment
timeframe following the Register
publication of the Notice of Proposed

Rulemaking.
You can also submit to the
Governor’s  Regulatory = Review

Council written comments that are
relevant to the Council’s power to
review a given rule (A.R.S. § 41-
1052). The Council reviews the rule at
the end of the rulemaking process and
before the rules are filed with the
Secretary of State.

Arizona Regular Rulemaking Process

START HERE

APA, statute or ballot
proposition is
passed. It gives an
agency authority to
make rules.

It may give an
agency an exemption
to the process or
portions thereof.

>

Agency opens a
docket.

Agency files a Notice of
Rulemaking Docket
Opening; it is published
in the Register. Often
an agency will file the
docket with the
proposed rulemaking.

Agency decides not to
act and closes docket.

The agency may let
the docket lapse by
not filing a Notice of
Proposed rulemaking
within one year.

|

Agency drafts'proposed rule
and Economic Impact
Statement (EIS); informal
public review/comment.

|

\J
Agency files Notice of
Proposed Rulemaking.

Notice is published in
the Register.

Notice of meetings may
be published in
Register or included in
Preamble of Proposed
Rulemaking.

Agency opens
comment period.

Agency decides not to
proceed and does not file
final rule with G.R.R.C.
within one year after
proposed rule is
published. AR.S. § 41-
1021(A)(4).

Agency decides not to
proceed and files Notice
of Termination of
Rulemaking for
publication in Register.
AR.S. § 41-1021(A)(2).

>

Agency files Notice
of Supplemental
Proposed

Rulemaking. Notice >

Register.

Oral proceedi‘ng and close of
record. Comment period must last
at least 30 days after publication
of notice. Oral proceeding

(hearing) is held no sooner

30 days after publication of notice

of hearing

Agency decides not to
proceed; files Notice of
Termination of
Rulemaking. May open

than a new Docket.

published in

Substantial change?

— A

-

If no change then

Y

.

Rule must be submitted for review or terminated within 120 days after the close of the record,

Y

A final rulemaking package is submitted to G.R.R.C. or A.G. for review. Contains final
preamble, rules, and Economic Impact Statement.

G.R.R.C. has 90 days to review and approve or return the rule package, in whole or in part;

A.G. has 60 days.

Y

After approval by G.R.R.C. or A.G., the rule becomes effective 60 days after filing with the
Secretary of State (unless otherwise indicated).

Final rule is published in the Register and the quarterly Code Supplement.

November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48

2969



/\ki; Rulemaking Guide

Arizona Administrative REGISTER

Definitions

Arizona Administrative Code (A.A.C.): Official rules codified and published
by the Secretary of State’s Office. Available online at www.azsos.gov.

Arizona Administrative Register (A.A.R.): The official publication that
includes filed documents pertaining to Arizona rulemaking. Available online at
WWW.azZS0Ss.ZOoV.

Administrative Procedure Act (APA): A.R.S. Title 41, Chapter 6, Articles 1
through 10. Available online at www.azleg.gov.

Arizona Revised Statutes (A.R.S.): The statutes are made by the Arizona
State Legislature during a legislative session. They are complied by Legislative
Council, with the official publication codified by Thomson West. Citations to
statutes include Titles which represent broad subject areas. The Title number is
followed by the Section number. For example, A.R.S. § 41-1001 is the
definitions Section of Title 41 of the Arizona Administrative Procedures Act.
The “§” symbol simply means “section.” Available online at www.azleg.gov.

Chapter: A division in the codification of the Code designating a state
agency or, for a large agency, a major program.

Close of Record: The close of the public record for a proposed rulemaking is
the date an agency chooses as the last date it will accept public comments, either
written or oral.

Code of Federal Regulations (CFR): The Code of Federal Regulations is a
codification of the general and permanent rules published in the Federal Register
by the executive departments and agencies of the federal government.

Docket: A public file for each rulemaking containing materials related to the
proceedings of that rulemaking. The docket file is established and maintained by
an agency from the time it begins to consider making a rule until the rulemaking
is finished. The agency provides public notice of the docket by filing a Notice of
Rulemaking Docket Opening with the Office for publication in the Register.

Economic, Small Business, and Consumer Impact Statement (EIS): The
EIS identifies the impact of the rule on private and public employment, on small
businesses, and on consumers. It includes an analysis of the probable costs and
benefits of the rule. An agency includes a brief summary of the EIS in its
preamble. The EIS is not published in the Register but is available from the
agency promulgating the rule. The EIS is also filed with the rulemaking package.

Governor’s Regulatory Review (G.R.R.C.): Reviews and approves rules to
ensure that they are necessary and to avoid unnecessary duplication and adverse
impact on the public. GR.R.C. also assesses whether the rules are clear, concise,
understandable, legal, consistent with legislative intent, and whether the benefits
of a rule outweigh the cost.

Incorporated by Reference: An agency may incorporate by reference
standards or other publications. These standards are available from the state
agency with references on where to order the standard or review it online.

Federal Register (FR): The Federal Register is a legal newspaper published
every business day by the National Archives and Records Administration
(NARA). It contains federal agency regulations; proposed rules and notices; and
executive orders, proclamations, and other presidential documents.

Session Laws or “Laws”: When an agency references a law that has not yet
been codified into the Arizona Revised Statutes, use the word “Laws” is followed
by the year the law was passed by the Legislature, followed by the Chapter
number using the abbreviation “Ch.”, and the specific Section number using the
Section symbol (§). For example, Laws 1995, Ch. 6, § 2. Session laws are
available at www.azleg.gov.

United States Code (U.S.C.): The Code is a consolidation and codification
by subject matter of the general and permanent laws of the United States. The
Code does not include regulations issued by executive branch agencies, decisions
of the federal courts, treaties, or laws enacted by state or local governments.

Acronyms
A.A.C. — Arizona Administrative Code

A.A.R. — Arizona Administrative Reg-
ister

APA — Administrative Procedure Act
A.R.S. — Arizona Revised Statutes
CFR - Code of Federal Regulations

EIS — Economic, Small Business, and
Consumer Impact Statement

FR — Federal Register

G.R.R.C. — Governor’s Regulatory
Review Council

U.S.C. = United States Code

About Preambles

The Preamble is the part of a
rulemaking package that contains
information about the rulemaking and
provides agency justification and
regulatory intent.

It includes reference to the specific
statutes authorizing the agency to
make the rule, an explanation of the
rule, reasons for proposing the rule,
and the preliminary Economic Impact
Statement.

The information in the Preamble
differs between rulemaking notices
used and the stage of the rulemaking.

2970

Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



e

Notices of Final Rulemaking Arizona Administrative REGISTER

NOTICES OF FINAL RULEMAKING

This section of the Arizona Administrative Register text of the rules as filed by the agency. Economic Impact

contains Notices of Final Rulemaking. Final rules have Statements are not published.

been through the regular rulemaking process as defined in The Office of the Secretary of State is the filing office and
the Administrative Procedures Act. These rules were publisher of these rules. Questions about the interpretation
either approved by the Governor's Regulatory Review of the final rules should be addressed to the agency that
Council or the Attorney General's Office. Certificates of promulgated them. Refer to ltem #5 to contact the person
Approval are on file with the Office. charged with the rulemaking. The codified version of these

=

[

[

[+

[0

6.

The final published notice includes a preamble and rules will be published in the Arizona Administrative Code.

NOTICE OF FINAL RULEMAKING
TITLE 4. PROFESSIONS AND OCCUPATIONS

CHAPTER 11. STATE BOARD OF DENTAL EXAMINERS

[R15-168]
PREAMBLE
Articles, Parts, or Sections Affected (as applicable) Rulemaking Action
R4-11-1701 Amend

Citations to the agency’s statutory rulemaking authority to include the authorizing statute (general) and the

implementing statute (specific):
Authorizing statute: A.R.S. § 32-1207(A)(1)

Implementing statute: A.R.S. §§ 32-1263.01 and 32-1263.02
The effective date of the rule:
January 2, 2016

Citations to all related notices published in the Register as specified in R1-1-409(A) that pertain to the record of

the proposed rule:
Notice of Rulemaking Docket Opening: 21 A.A.R. 524, April 10, 2015

Notice of Proposed Rulemaking: 21 A.A.R. 671, May 15, 2015
The agency’s contact person who can answer questions about the rulemaking:
Name: Elaine Hugunin, Executive Director

Address: State Board of Dental Examiners
4205 N. 7th Ave., Suite 300
Phoenix, AZ 85013

Telephone: (602) 542-4493

Fax: (602) 242-1445
E-mail: elaine.hugunin@azdentalboard.us
Website: www.dentalboard.az.gov

An agency’s justification and reason why a rule should be made, amended. repealed or renumbered. to include

an explanation about the rulemaking:
The Five-Year rule review identified necessary amendments to A.A.C. Title 4, Chapter 11, Article 17 Rehearing or

Review. The Five-Year Rule Review proposed action included:

Deleting the last sentence in R4-11-1701(G) as it is inconsistent with A.R.S. § 41- 1092.09, and

The word “party” in A.A.C. R4-11-1701(A) should be changed to “licensee” to be consistent with A.R.S. 32-
1263.02(H).
The rule will include format, style, and grammar necessary to comply with the current rules of the Secretary of
State.

The Board believes that approval of these rules will benefit the public health and safety by clearly establishing the
procedures for a rehearing or review of a Board order.

November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48 2971



Arizona Administrative REGISTER Notices of Final Rulemaking _{_

1.

[

(N

A reference to any study relevant to the rule that the agency reviewed and proposes either to rely on or not to rely
on in its evaluation of or justification for the rule. where the public may obtain or review each study. all data
underlying each study. and any analysis of each study and other supporting material:

The agency did not review or rely on any study relevant to the rule.

A showing of good cause why the rules are necessary to promote a statewide interest if the rules will diminish a
previous grant of authority of a political subdivision of this state:
Not applicable

The summary of the economic, small business, and consumer impact:
The amended rule will impact the Board, licensees, and the public. The amended rule's impact on established Board
of Dental Examiners' procedures and office related costs is minimal. The rule will have no economic cost for the
Board, but may have potential unmeasurable benefits.

The Board estimates the amended rule will have no economic impact on licensees.
The amended rule has no economic impact on the public.

The Board, licensees, and the public benefit from rules that are clear, concise, and understandable. The Board
believes that approval of these rules will benefit the public health and safety by clearly establishing the procedures
for a rehearing or review of a Board order.

10. A description of any changes between the proposed rulemaking. to include supplemental notices, and the final

rulemaking:
There are no substantial changes in the final rules from the proposed rules. Minor changes to style, format, gram-

mar, and punctuation were made as requested by GRRC staff.

11. An agency’s summary of the public stakeholder comments made about the rulemaking and the agency response

to the comments:
A public hearing was held June 22, 2015. No one attended the hearing and no written comments were received.

12. All agencies shall list other matters prescribed by statute applicable to the specific agency or to any specific rule

or _class of rules. Additionally, an agency subject to Council review under A.R.S. §§ 41-1052 and 41-1055 shall
respond to the following questions:

Not applicable
a. Whether the rule requires a permit, whether a general permit is used and if not. the reasons why a general

permit is not used:
The rules do not require a permit.

b. Whether a federal law is applicable to the subject of the rule, whether the rule is more stringent than federal
law and if so. citation to the statutory authority to exceed the requirements of federal law:

The agency has determined that there is no corresponding federal law.

Whether a person submitted an analysis to the agency that compares the rule’s impact of the competitiveness
of business in this state to the impact on business in other states:
No

A list of any incorporated by reference material as specified in A.R.S. § 41-1028 and its location in the rules:
None

I*

14. Whether the rule was previously made, amended or repealed as an emergency rule. If so, cite the notice

15.

published in the Register as specified in R1-1-409(A). Also. the agency shall state where the text was changed

between the emergency and the final rulemaking packages:
No

The full text of the rules follows:

TITLE 4. PROFESSIONS AND OCCUPATIONS

CHAPTER 11. STATE BOARD OF DENTAL EXAMINERS

ARTICLE 17. REHEARING OR REVIEW

R4-11-1701. Procedure

ARTICLE 17. REHEARING OR REVIEW

R4-11-1701. Procedure

A.

Except as provided in subsection (F), a party licensee, certificate holder, or business entity who is aggrieved by an order
issued by the Board may file a written motion for rehearing or review with the Board, pursuant to A.R.S. Title 41, Chap-
ter 6, Article 10, specifying the grounds for rehearing or review.

2972 Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



1 . . .
/3»«}, Notices of Final Rulemaking Arizona Administrative REGISTER

B. A party licensee, certificate holder. or business entity filing a motion for rehearing or review under this rule may amend
the motion at any time before it is ruled upon by the Board. Otherparties-or-the-attorney-general The opposing party
may file a response within 15 days after the date the motion for rehearing or review is filed. The Board may require that
the parties file supplemental memoranda explaining the issues raised in the motion, and may permit oral argument.

C. The Board may grant a rehearing or review of the order for any of the following causes materially affecting a party's
licensee, certificate holder, or business entity's rights:

1. Irregularity in the proceedings of the Board or any order or abuse of discretion, which deprived a party licensee,
certificate holder, or business entity of a fair hearrng,

2. Misconduct of the Board, its personnel, the FA 0
hearing-officer; the administrative law judge, or the prevalhng party,

3. Accident or surprise which could not have been prevented by ordinary prudence;

4. Excessive or insufficient penalties;

5. Error in the admission or rejection of evidence or other errors of law occurring at the hearing or during the progress
of the proceeding;

6. That the findings of fact or decision is arbitrary, capricious, or an abuse of discretion;

7. That the findings of fact of decision is not justified by the evidence or is contrary to law; or

8. Newly discovered, material evidence which could not, with reasonable diligence, have been discovered and pro-
duced at the original hearing.

D. The Board may affirm or modify the order or grant a rehearlng or review t0 all or any—ef—the—paftres—eﬂ—a{-l—er part of the
issues for any of the reasons in subsectron (C) 0 S a

Board W1th1n the trme for ﬁlrng a motion for rehearlng or rev1ew may grant a rehearrng or review on its own initiative
for any reason for which it might have granted relief on motion of a party. An order granting a rehearing or review shall
specify the grounds on which rehearing or review is granted, and any rehearing or review shall cover only those matters
specified.

E. When a motion for rehearing or review is based upon affidavits, they shall be served with the motion. An opposing party

may, within 15 days after such service, serve opposing affidavits.

F. If the Board makes specific findings that the immediate effectiveness of the order is necessary for the preservation of
public health and safety and that a rehearing or review is impracticable, unnecessary, or contrary to the public interest,
the order may be issued as a final order without an opportunity for a rehearing or review. If an order is issued as a final
order without an opportunity or rehearing or review, the aggrieved party shall make an application for judicial review of
the order within the time limits permitted for application for judicial review of the Board's final order.

G. The Board shall rule on the motion for rehearing or review within 15 days after the response has been filed, or at the

Board's next meetrng after the motron 1s recerved whrchever is later Irﬂa—reheafmg—er—reﬂew—rs—gmﬂted—the—Beafd—s-ha{-}

NOTICE OF FINAL RULEMAKING
TITLE 4. PROFESSIONS AND OCCUPATIONS

CHAPTER 36. DEPARTMENT OF FIRE, BUILDING AND LIFE SAFETY

[R15-169]
PREAMBLE
1. Articles. Parts. and Sections Affected (as applicable) Rulemaking Action
R4-36-201 Amend
R4-36-301 Amend
R4-36-302 Amend
R4-36-303 Amend
R4-36-304 Amend
R4-36-305 Amend
R4-36-307 Amend
R4-36-308 Amend
R4-36-309 Amend
R4-36-310 Amend
R4-36-311 Repeal

2. Citations to the agency's statutory rulemaking authority to include both the authorizing statute (general) and the
implementing statute (specific):
Authorizing statute: A.R.S. § 41-2146(C)

Implementing statute: A.R.S. § 41-2163

November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48 2973



Arizona Administrative REGISTER Notices of Final Rulemaking _{_

3. The effective date for the rules:
January 2, 2016

a. Ifthe agency selected a date earlier than the 60-day effective date as specified in A.R.S. § 41-1032(A). include
the earlier date and state the reason or reasons the agency selected the earlier effective date as provided in
A.R.S. § 41-1032(A)(1) through (5):

Not applicable
If the agency selected a date later than the 60-day effective date as specified in A.R.S. § 41-1032(A). include
the later date and state the reason or reasons the agency selected the later effective date as provided in A.R.S.

§ 41-1032(B):
Not applicable

=

[+

Citation to all related notices published in the Register as specified in R1-1-409(A) that pertain to the record of

the final rulemaking package:
Notice of Rulemaking Docket Opening: 21 A.A.R. 1123, July 17, 2015

Notice of Proposed Rulemaking: 21 A.A.R. 1077, July 17,2015
The agency's contact person who can answer questions about the rulemaking:
Name: Frederick Durham, Assistant State Fire Marshal

Address: Department of Fire, Building and Life Safety
1110 W. Washington St.; Suite 100
Phoenix, AZ 85007-2935

Telephone: (602) 364-1080

[0

Fax: (602) 364-1052
E-mail: Frederick.durham@dfbls.az.gov
Web site: www.dfbls.az.gov

6. An agency's justification and reason why a rule should be made. amended. repealed, or renumbered, to include

an explanation about the rulemaking:
The State Fire Safety Committee is updating the State Fire Code to the 2012 edition of the International Fire Code.

The State Fire Code is designed to reduce hazards to life, property, and public welfare arising from fire, explosions,
or dangerous conditions in new and existing buildings, structures, and premises and to provide safety to fire fighters
and emergency responders. The state’s current fire code is the 2003 edition of the International Fire Code. Some of
the requirements in the 2003 edition are no longer consistent with current industry standards regarding best prac-
tices. For example, the 2012 edition changes occupancy classifications to provide greater protection for those who
might be unable to save themselves. New requirements regarding roof obstructions provide greater safety for first
responders. Keys for elevator emergency response are now standardized. Emergency responder radio coverage is
required in new buildings. Safety requirements for solar photovoltaic power systems are addressed as are emer-
gency notification systems in large stadiums and arenas. Improved fire alarm systems are now required in educa-
tional occupancies and carbon monoxide alarms are required in certain occupancies. The adoption of the new code
is necessary to achieve the objective of protecting public safety.

An exemption from Executive Order 2015-01 was provided for this rulemaking by Ted Vogt, Chief of Operations in
the Governor’s office, in an e-mail dated May 7, 2015.

[~

A reference to any study relevant to the rule that the agency reviewed and either relied on or did not rely on in its
evaluation of or justification for the rule. where the public may obtain or review each study. all data underlyving

each study. and any analysis of each study and other supporting material:
The Committee neither reviewed nor relied on a study in its evaluation of or justification for any of the rules in this

rulemaking.

A showmg of good cause why the rulemaklng is necessary to promote a statew1de interest if the rulemaking will

[°

Not applicable

[

A summary of the economic, small business, and consumer impact:
The economic impact of the new fire code is minimized because the construction and design provisions of the new
fire code apply only to structures, facilities, and conditions arising after or not legally in existence when the new
fire code is adopted. The impact is further minimized by the fact that most of the people in Arizona live in jurisdic-
tions that have opted, under the provisions in A.R.S. §§ 41-2162(A)(2), 41-2163(A)(2), and 41-2166(A), to already
comply with a fire code that is at least as stringent as the new fire code.

10. A description of any changes between the proposed rulemaking, including supplemental notices. and the final

rulemaking:
A few typographical errors were corrected in the final rules.

2974 Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



e/

_{__ Notices of Final Rulemaking Arizona Administrative REGISTER

11. An agency's summary of the public or stakeholder comments made about the rulemaking and the agency

response to comments:
An oral proceeding was held on August 20, 2015. Two individuals attended and made oral comments. Mr. William

Loesche of the Golder Ranch Fire District spoke in support of adopting the 2012 International Fire Code. He indi-
cated that the Golder Ranch Fire District is among the many fire districts that have already adopted the 2012 Inter-
national Fire Code. He said the code has a positive economic impact as a result of preventing fires and associated
loss of property and life and reducing the cost of insurance. The second speaker was Mr. David Keller, president of
the Automatic Fire Alarm Association of Arizona. He supported adoption of the 2012 International Fire Code
because of the need to ensure latest fire-prevention technology is authorized.

12. All agencies shall list any other matters prescribed by statute applicable to the specific agency or to any specific
rule or class of rules. Additionally, an agency subject to Council review under A.R.S. §§ 41-1052 and 41-1055
shall respond to the following questions:

None

Whether the rule requires a permit, whether a general permit is used and if not. the reasons why a general

permit is not used:

The permits required under the State Fire Code and described in R4-36-303 are general permits consistent with
A.R.S. § 41-1037 because they are issued to qualified individuals or entities to conduct activities that are sub-
stantially similar in nature.

Whether a federal law is applicable to the subject of the rule, whether the rule is more stringent than federal
law and if so. citation to the statutory authority to exceed the requirements of federal law:

The rules are not more stringent than federal law. There are numerous federal laws relating to some of the same
subject matter as the State Fire Code. For example, there are federal laws dealing with hazardous materials,
protection of certain categories of individuals, consumer protections, and environmental protection. However,
the International Code Council, which developed the International Fire Code, has ensured that the code is con-
sistent with federal law.

[

=

Whether a person submitted an analysis to the agency that compares the rule's impact of the competitiveness

of business in this state to the impact on business in other states:
No analysis was submitted.

I

13. A list of any incorporated by reference material as specified in A.R.S. § 41-1028 and its location in the rule:
The following is incorporated by reference in R4-36-201:
International Fire Code, 2012 edition, published by the International Code Council, 4051 W. Flossmoor Road,
Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795

14. Whether the rule was previously made, amended. or repealed as an emergency rule. If so. cite the notice

published in the Register as specified in R1-1-409(A). Also. the agency shall state where the text was changed

between the emergency and the final rulemaking packages:
None of the rules in this rulemaking was previously made, amended, or repealed as an emergency rule.

15. The full text of the rules follows:

TITLE 4. PROFESSIONS AND OCCUPATIONS

CHAPTER 36. DEPARTMENT OF FIRE, BUILDING AND LIFE SAFETY

ARTICLE 2. ARIZONA STATE FIRE CODE

Section
R4-36-201.  Incorporation by Reference of the International Fire Code

ARTICLE 3. INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE MODIFICATIONS

Section

R4-36-301. Definitions

R4-36-302. Appendices

R4-36-303.  Permits

R4-36-304.  Inspections and Enforcement
R4-36-305. General Precautions Against Fire
R4-36-307.  Fire Service Features
R4-36-308.  Building Services and Systems
R4-36-309. Fire Protection Systems
R4-36-310.  Explosives and Fireworks
R4-36-311. Referenced-Standards Repealed

November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48 2975



Arizona Administrative REGISTER Notices of Final Rulemaking _{_

ARTICLE 2. ARIZONA STATE FIRE CODE

R4-36-201.  Incorporation by Reference of the International Fire Code

Unless otherwise provided by law, any person residing, doing business, or who is physically present within the state
of Arizona shall comply with the provisions of the International Fire Code (2003 2012 Edition), including D102.1
and D107.1 of Appendix D and all provisions of Appendices B, C, E, F, and G, H, 1. and J, which is published by
the International Code Council, incorporated by reference as the State Fire Code, and modified by Article 3. The
incorporated material does not include any later amendments or editions. Copies of the International Fire Code are
available from the International Code Council, 4051 W. Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795 and a
copy is available for inspection at the Office of the State Fire Marshal.

ARTICLE 3. INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE MODIFICATIONS
R4-36-301. Definitions

The follow1ng terms apply to the state—ﬁre—eode State Fire Code estabhshed in th1s Chapter
+ o

2

2-1. Wherever the terms “fire chief” or “fire code official” are used in the International Fire Code, these terms include
the State Fire Marshal or the State Fire Marshal’s designated representative, unless the context otherwise requires.
3.2. Wherever the terms “fire department” or “department of fire prevention” are used in the International Fire Code,
these terms include the State Fire Marshal or the State Fire Marshal’s designated representative unless the context
otherwise requires.
4-3. Section 202, the definition of Occupancy Classification for R-3 within the Residential Group is modified to read:
Residential occupancres where the occupan01es are prlmarlly permanent in nature and not classrﬁed as R-1,R-2,R-
4, or I an h He 2 a mere-than-five-dweling-un .ncludrng
Boarding houses (non- trans1ent) with 16 or fewer occupants
Boarding houses (transient) with 10 or fewer occupants
Building that do not contain more than four dwelling units
Care facilities that provide accommodations for five or fewer persons receiving care
Congregate living facilities (non-transient) with 16 or fewer occupants
Congregate living facilities (transient) with 10 or fewer occupants

Care facilities within a dwelling. Care facilities for five or fewer persons receiving care that are within a single-

family dwelling are permitted to comply with the International Residential Code provided an automatic sprinkler
system is installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.3 or Section P2904 of the International Residential Code.

R4-36-302.  Appendices
The Internatronal F1re Code (2993 2012 Edrtlon) whrch is 1ncorporated by reference at R4 36 201 is pebhshed—by—t-he—l-nter—

6947—8—54—95—31&6 modlﬁed as shown in Exhlblt A.

EXHIBIT A. Incorporated Appendices

Section 101.2.1 The following appendices are adopted as part of this Code:

B: Fire-Flow Requirements for Buildings

C: Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution

i Losading

D102.1 or the minimum requirement of the local fire response agency:

D107.1 or the minimum requirement of the local building/ or subdivision authority-

E: Hazard Categories

F: Hazard Ranking

G: Cryogenic Fluids — Weight and Volume Equivalents

H. Hazardous Materials Management Plan (HMMP) and Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement (HMIS)

Instructions
I.  Fire Protection Systems — Noncompliant Conditions

J.  Building Information Sign

R4-36-303.  Permits
A. The following time-frames are established for permits issued under the state-fire-eede State Fire Code:

1. The Office of the State Fire Marshal shall determine within five business days frem after receipt of a permit appli-
cation and plan submission whether the permit application and plan are administratively complete and ready for
review.

2. The Office of the State Fire Marshal shall either grant or deny the permit within 60 calendar days frem-the-date-that
after the documents are determined to be administratively complete.

2976 Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



1 . . .
/3»«}, Notices of Final Rulemaking Arizona Administrative REGISTER

3. The A permittee shall commence work within 180 days efthe-issuanee-ef-a after the permit is issued or apply in
writing for an extension #-writing from the State Fire Marshal. Without an extension, the permit is valid only for
180 days from the date of issuance.
B. The holder of an operational or construction permit is entitled to inspections as prescribed in this Chapter. Reinspeetion
beeause-of The Office of the State Fire Marshal shall invoice a re-inspection caused by a violation or cancellation with-
out 24-hetrs 24-hours’ notice shalt-be-inveiced at a rate established in the fee schedule; and shall not conduct the rein-
re-inspection until the fee is paid.
Section 105.1.1 is modified to read: Permits required. Any property owner or authorized agent that intends to conduct an
operation or business, install or modify systems and equipment that are regulated by this code, or cause any such work
to be done, shall first make application to the fire code official and obtain the required permit. The fire code official is
authorized to waive the requirement for any permit listed in sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.46 and 105.7.1 through
107.16.
&:D.Section 105.1.2 is modified to read: Types of permits. There shall be two types of permits as follows:
1. Operational permit. An operational permit allows the applicant to conduct an operation for which a permit is
required by Section 105.6 for a period that does not exceed 180 days from the date of issuance.
2. Construction permit. A construction permit allows the applicant to install or modify systems and equipment for
which a permit is required by Section 105.7.
B:E.Section 105.2.4, the first sentence is modified to read: The fire code official shall examine or cause to be examined each
application for a permit or a permit amendment.
E:F. Section 105.3.1, the first sentence is modified to read: An operational permit shall remain in effect until reissued,
renewed, or revoked or for a-pertod-of time-that-deesnotexeeed 180 days.
¥:G. Section 105.3.3;thesenteree is modified to read: Occupancy prohibited before approval. The building or structure shall
not be occupied prior to the fire code official issuing a report indicating that applicable provisions of this code have been

@

met
Seetions105-6-1through105-63-are-deleted:
Seettons105:6-5-through105-6-13-are-deleted:
Seetions105-6:38-through105-6-42-are-deleted:
Seetions105:6:45-through105-6-47-are-deleted:
Seetion105-751is-deleted:

PrETFFTED

R4-36-304.  Inspections and Enforcement
A - 4
B:A.SeetionsH08threugh1083are-deleted: Section 108.1 is modified to read: Board of appeals established. To hear and

decide appeals of orders, decisions, or other determinations made by the fire code official regarding application or inter-
pretation of this code, the authority having jurisdiction may establish a board of appeals. If established, the board of

appeals shall be appointed by and hold office at the pleasure of the governing body. The fire code official shall be an ex
officio member of the board of appeal with no vote on any matter before the board. The board of appeals shall adopt

rules of procedure for conducting its business. The board of appeals shall provide a written copy of the findings and
decision in an appeal to the appellant and fire code official.

€:B.Section 1093 109.4 is modified to read: Violation penalties. If a person violates a provision of this code or fails to com-
ply with any of the requirements of the code, the State Fire Marshal shall proceed in accordance with A.R.S. § 41-2196.

B:C.Section 111.2 is modified to read: Issuance. The State Fire Marshal shall issue a stop work order, referred to in statute as
a cease and desist order, in accordance with A.R.S. § 41-2196.

E=D.Section 111.4 is modified to read: Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work having been served with
a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, is
subject to the provisions of A.R.S. § 41-2196.

R4-36-305.  General Precautions Against Fire
A. Section 307.2 is modified to read: Permit required. A When required by the fire code official, a permit shall be obtained
in accordance with requirements-of-the Department-of Environmental-Quality Section 105.6 before kindling a fire for

recognized silvicultural or range or wildlife management practices, prevention or control of disease or pests, or a bon-
fire. Application for the required permit shall only be made by and a permit issued to the owner of the land upon which

the fire is to be kindled.

B. Section 311.1.1 is modified to read: Abandoned premises. Abatement-of-abandenedstraetures—and-premises—shall-be
condueted Buildings, structures, and premises for which an owner cannot be identified or located by dispatch of a certif-
icate of mailing to the last known or registered address, which persistently or repeatedly become unprotected or unse-
cured, which have been occupied by unauthorized persons or for illegal purposes, or which present a danger of

structural collapse or fire spread to adjacent properties shall be considered abandoned, declared unsafe, and abated in
accordance with state law.

R4-36-307. Fire Service Features

November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48 2977



Arizona Administrative REGISTER Notices of Final Rulemaking _{_

A. Section 501.2 is modified to read: Permits. A permit shall be required as set forth in Sections 105.6 and 105.7 as modi-
fied by this Article.

B. Section 5691 508.1.1 the-seeend-sentenee is modified to read: Location and access. The location and accessibility of the
fire command center shall be approved by a local authorized emergency response provider.

R4-36-308.  Building Services and Systems

B-:A.Section 606.2 is modified to read: Refrigerants. The use and purity of new, recovered, and reclaimed refrigerants shall
be in accordance with state law.

€:B.Section 60613 606.14 is modified to read: Notification of refrigerant discharges. The fire department shall be notified
immediately when a discharge becomes reportable under state, federal, or local regulations in accordance with Section
270331 5003.3.1.

B-C.Sections 27633+ 5003.3.1 and 2703314 5003.3.1.4 replace “fire code official” with “fire department.”

R4-36-309.  Fire Protection Systems

As  Section 901.1 is modified to read: Scope. The provisions of this Chapter shall specify where fire protection systems are
required and shall apply to the design, installation, inspection, operation, testing, and maintenance of all fire protection
systems. Absent specific statutory authority to the contrary, these provisions provide the minimum protective standards
relatrng to fire protectlon systems

R4-36-310.  Explosives and Fireworks
A Sectron 330413; 5601 L. 3 the—ﬁrst—par&graph—ls modlﬁed to read Flreworks Ereept—af—efka%se—pfmﬁded—bjﬁ—R—S—

A—R—S—ééé—l—é@%&%—} The possess1on= manufacture, storage, sale, handhng, and use of ﬁreworks are p_rohrbrted
Exceptions:
1. Storage and handling of fireworks as allowed in Section 5604.

Z Manufacture, assembly and testing of fireworks as allowed in Section 5605.
3. The use of fireworks for fireworks displays as allowed in Section 5608.
4.

The possession, storage, sale, handling and use of specific types of Division 1.4G fireworks where allowed by

A.R.S. Title 36, Chapter 13, Article 1 or local ordinances and regulations, provided the fireworks comply with 16
CFR Parts 1500 and 1507 and 49 CFR Parts 100 185 for consumer ﬁreworks

2978 Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



e/

_{__ Notices of Final Exempt Rulemaking Arizona Administrative REGISTER

NOTICES OF FINAL EXEMPT RULEMAKING

This section of the Arizona Administrative Register interpretation of the final exempt rule should be addressed to
contains Notices of Final Exempt Rulemaking. the agency proposing them. Refer to ltem #5 to contact the
The Office of the Secretary of State is the filing office  person charged with the rulemaking.
and publisher of these rules. Questions about the

NOTICE OF FINAL EXEMPT RULEMAKING
TITLE 21. CHILD SAFETY

CHAPTER 5. DEPARTMENT OF CHILD SAFETY
PERMANENCY AND SUPPORT SERVICES

[R15-172]
PREAMBLE
1. Article, Part. or Section Affected (as applicable) Rulemaking Action
Article 1 New Article
R21-5-101 New Section
R21-5-102 New Section
R21-5-103 New Section
R21-5-104 New Section
R21-5-105 New Section
R21-5-106 New Section
R21-5-107 New Section
2. Citations to the agency’s statutory rulemaking authority to include the authorizing statute (general) and the
implementing statute (specific), and the statute or session law authorizing the exemption:
Authorizing statute: A.R.S. § 8-453(A)(5)
Implementing statute: A.R.S. §§ 8-548 through 8-548.06, and A.R.S. § 8-453(A)(9)(a)
Statute or session law authorizing the exemption: Laws 2014, Second Special Session, Ch. 1, § 158
3. The effective date of the rule and the agency’s reason it selected the effective date:
January 2, 2016. The Department has selected this date to be in compliance with A.R.S. § 41-1032.
4. A list of all notices published in the Register as specified in R1-1-409(A) that pertain to the record of the exempt
rulemaking:
Notice of Public Information: 21 A.A.R. 1051, July 10, 2015
Notice of Oral Proceeding: 21 A.A.R. 1055, July 10, 2015
5. The agency’s contact person who can answer questions about the rulemaking:
Name: Carrie Senseman, Lead Rules Analyst
Address: Arizona Department of Child Safety
Policy Office

3003 N. Central Ave., 23rd Floor
Phoenix, AZ 85012

P.O. Box 6030, Site Code: C010-23
Phoenix, AZ 85005-6030

Telephone: (602) 255-2534

Fax: (602) 255-3264

E-mail: csenseman@azdes.gov

Web site:  https://dcs.az.gov/about/dcs-rules-rulemaking

6. An agency’s justification and reason why a rule should be made. amended. repealed. or renumbered to include

an explanation about the rulemaking:
AR.S. §§ 8-548 through 8-548.06, and A.R.S. § 8-453(A)(9)(a) establish the Interstate Compact on the Placement

of Children (ICPC), into law, and authorizes the Department to cooperate with other states in the interstate place-

November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48 2979



Arizona Administrative REGISTER Notices of Final Exempt Rulemaking _{_

[~

ment of children in a suitable environment and with persons or institutions having appropriate qualifications to pro-
vide care for children in the custody of the Department.

Laws 2014, Second Special Session, Ch. 1, § 158 exempts the Department from the rulemaking requirements of in
A.R.S. Title 14, Chapter 6 until November 28, 2015, in order to “Adopt rules to implement the purposes of the
Department and the duties and powers of the director.” The Department received an exception from the Governor’s
rulemaking moratorium, established by Executive Order 2015-01, for this rulemaking and has added Chapter 5,
Article 1. The rules conform to the current rulemaking format and style requirements of the Office of the Secretary
of State.

A reference to any study relevant to the rule that the agency reviewed and either relied on or did not rely on in its
evaluation of or justification for the rule. where the public may obtain or review each study. all data underlyving
each study. and any analysis of each study and other supporting material:

None

A showing of good cause why the rulemaking is necessary to promote a statewide interest if the rulemaking will

diminish a previous grant of authority of a political subdivision of this state:

Not applicable

The summary of the economic. small business. and consumer impact, if applicable:
The Department was exempted from Title 41, Chapter 6 and therefore no Economic Impact Statement is required.

10. A description of any changes between the proposed rulemaking, including any supplemental proposed

rulemaking. and the final rulemaking package (if applicable):
Not applicable

11. An agency’s summary of the public or stakeholder comments made about the rulemaking and the agency

response to the comments, if applicable:
The Department’s exemption from rulemaking required the Department to provide public notice and an opportunity

for public comment in writing and at two or more public comment hearings. The exemption did not require the
Department to post its responses to the public comments. However, the Department provides the following infor-
mation on the public comment hearings and public comment.

Public hearings for Article 1, Interstate Compact on the Placement of Children rule package were held on July 20,
2015 in Tucson and July 21, 2015 in Phoenix. Attendees were given the opportunity to provide oral or written com-
ments. No comments were received at these meetings for this rule package. A copy of Article 1, Interstate Compact
on the Placement of Children, draft rules were posted on the Department’s website from June 17, 2015 to July 23,
2015, along with an on-line survey to obtain public comments. No comments were received for this rule package.

12. Any other matters prescribed by statute that are applicable to the specific agency or to any specific rule or class

of rules. When applicable, matters shall include, but not be limited to:
a. Whether the rule requires a permit, whether a general permit is used and if not, the reasons why a general

~ permit is not used:
Not applicable

b. Whether a federal law is applicable to the subject of the rule, whether the rule is more stringent than the fed-
eral law and if so, citation to the statutory authority to exceed the requirements of federal law:
Federal laws 42 U.S.C. 622, U.S.C. 675, U.S.C. 4671 and U.S.C. 5113 apply to this rulemaking. The rules are
not more stringent than federal law.

Whether a person submitted an analysis to the agency that compares the rule’s impact of the competitiveness
of business in this state to the impact on business in other states:

Not applicable

I

A list of any incorporated by reference material and its location in the rule:
None

14. Whether the rule was previously made., amended, repealed or renumbered as an emergency rule. If so. the

15.

agency shall state where the text changed between the emergency and the exempt rulemaking packages:
The rules were not previously made, amended, repealed, or renumbered as an emergency rule.

The full text of the rules follows:

2980 Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



Y . . .
/3»«}, Notices of Final Exempt Rulemaking Arizona Administrative REGISTER

TITLE 21. CHILD SAFETY

CHAPTER 5. DEPARTMENT OF CHILD SAFETY
PERMANENCY AND SUPPORT SERVICES

ARTICLE 1. INTERSTATE COMPACT ON THE PLACEMENT OF CHILDREN

Section

R21-5-101. Definitions

R21-5-102. Authority

R21-5-103. Conditions of Placement
R21-5-104. Financial Responsibility
R21-5-105. Applicability
R21-5-106. Placement Approval
R21-5-107. Operations

ARTICLE 1. INTERSTATE COMPACT ON THE PLACEMENT OF CHILDREN

R21-5-101. Definitions

The definitions contained in A.R.S. § 8-548 and the following definitions apply in this Article:

“Child” means any person less than the age of 18 years.

“Compact” or ‘ICPC” means the Interstate Compact on the Placement of Children.

“Compact Administrator” means the same as A.R.S. § 8-548.

“Compact State” means a state that is a member of the Interstate Compact on the Placement of Children.
“Department” or “DCS” means the Arizona Department of Child Safety.

“Interstate placement” means any movement of a child from one state to another state for the purpose of establish-
ing a suitable living environment and providing necessary care.

“Intra-state placement” means the placement of a child within a state by an agency of that state.

“Placement” means the same as in A.R.S. § 8-548.

“Receiving state” means the same as in A.R.S. § 8-548.

. “Sending agency” means the same as in A.R.S. § 8-548.

“Sending state” means the state where the sending agency is located, or the state in which the court holds exclusive
jurisdiction over a child, which causes, permits, or enables the child to be sent to another state.

[ [ [ 92 2 |

|“|\°I°°I\’
= e:

—
—

R21-5-102.  Authority
The ICPC is governed by A.R.S. §§ 8-548 through 8-548.06 and the ICPC regulations. ICPC regulations are posted on the

Association of Administrators of the Interstate Compact on the Placement of Children website. These regulations supple-
ment those authorities and must be read in conjunction with them.
R21-5-103. Conditions of Placement

No person, court, or public or private agency in a Compact State shall place a child in another Compact State until the Com-

pact Administrator in the receiving state has notified the Compact Administrator in the sending state, on a prescribed form,
that such placement does not appear to be contrary to the interests of the child and does not violate any applicable laws of the

receiving state.

R21-5-104. Financial Responsibility

The sending person, court, or public or private agency shall be held financially responsible for:
1. Sending the child to the receiving state;
2. Returning the child to the sending state; and

3. Treatment of the child during the period of placement.

R21-5-105.  Applicability

A. Except as listed in sub-section B, the ICPC applies to the placement of:
1. Children in another Compact State by an agency. court or person, which has care or custody of the children.

2. Foreign-born children who are brought under the jurisdiction of a Compact State by an international child placing
agency.

In addition to the children listed in statute that are not subject to ICPC, the ICPC does not apply:

1. When a child is placed in an institution caring for the mentally ill, mentally impaired. epileptic, or in any institution
primarily educational in character or in any hospital or other medical facility.

2. To the placement of children into and out of the United States when the other jurisdiction involved is a foreign

country.
3. When a sending court or agency seeks an independent (not ICPC related) courtesy check for placement with a par-

ent from whom the child was not removed, the responsibility for credentials and quality of the courtesy check rests
directly with the sending court or agency and the person or party in the receiving state who agrees to conduct the

=

November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48 2981



Arizona Administrative REGISTER Notices of Final Exempt Rulemaking _{_

courtesy check without invoking the protection of the ICPC home study process. This does not prohibit a sending
state from requesting an ICPC.

4. The Compact does not apply in court cases of paternity, divorce, custody, and probate pursuant to which or in situa-
tions where children are being placed with parents or relatives or non-relatives.

R21-5-106. Placement Approval
Sending and receiving states must obtain approval from the Compact Administrator in both the sending and receiving states

prior to the placement of a child in another Compact State.

R21-5-107. Operations

In providing services provided under this Article, the sending and the receiving state shall:

Maintain all information required by state and federal law.

Comply with all federal and their respective state laws and regulations regarding the disclosure and use of confiden-
tial health and personal information.

Comply with all federal and their respective state non-discrimination laws and regulations.

Ensure that interpreters. including assistance for the visually or hearing impaired, are available to those receiving
services at no cost.

[ =

||

2982 Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



e/

4 Docket Opening Notices Arizona Administrative REGISTER

NOTICES OF RULEMAKING DOCKET OPENING

This section of the Arizona Administrative Register Under the APA effective January 1, 1995, agencies must
contains Notices of Rulemaking Docket Opening. submit a Notice of Rulemaking Docket Opening before

A docket opening is the first part of the administrative beginning the formal rulemaking process. Many times an
rulemaking process. It is an “announcement” that the agency may file the Notice of Rulemaking Docket Opening
agency intends to work on its rules. with the Notice of Proposed Rulemaking.

When an agency opens a rulemaking docket to The Office of the Secretary of State is the filing office and
consider rulemaking, the Administrative Procedure Act publisher of these notices. Questions about the interpretation
(APA) requires the publication of the Notice of Rulemaking  of this information should be directed to the agency contact
Docket Opening. person listed in item #4 of this notice.

=

[

[

[+

[

[

NOTICE OF RULEMAKING DOCKET OPENING

BOARD FOR PRIVATE POSTSECONDARY EDUCATION

[R15-173]
Title and its heading: 4, Professions and Occupations
Chapter and its heading: 39, Board for Private Postsecondary Educations
Article and its heading: é, ]F)eﬁnitions, Licensure, Reporting
, Fees

3, Operation of Private Non-accredited Institutions
4, Operation of all Licensed Institutions

5, Investigations and Hearing Procedures

6, Student Tuition Recovery Fund

Section numbers: R4-39-101 through R4-39-111; R4-39-201; R4-39-301 through
R4-39-308; R4-39-401 through R4-39-408; R4-39-501through
R4-39-504; and R4-39-601 through R4-39-603. Additional
Sections may be made, amended, or deleted as needed.

The subject matter of the proposed rule:
In response to a five-year-review report approved by Council on September 13, 2011, the Board is amending all of

its rules to ensure they are consistent with statute and agency and industry practice. The language of the rules is also
being updated.

A citation to all published notices relating to the proceeding:
None

Name and address of agency personnel with whom persons may communicate regarding the rule:
Name: Teri Stanfill, Executive Director

Address: 1400 W. Washington St., Room 260
Phoenix, AZ 85007

Telephone: (602) 542-5709

Fax: (602) 542-1253
E-mail: teri.stanfill@azppse.az.gov
Web site: WWW.ppse.az.gov

The time during which the agency will accept written comments and the time and place where oral comments

may be made:
The Board will accept comments during business hours at the address listed in item 4. Information regarding an oral

proceeding will be included in the Notice of Proposed Rulemaking.

A timetable for agency decisions or other action on the proceeding, if known:
To be determined

November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48 2983



e/

{_ Proposed Delegation Agreements

_—

Arizona Administrative REGISTER

NOTICES OF PROPOSED DELEGATION AGREEMENT

This section of the Arizona Administrative Register
contains Notices of Proposed Delegation Agreements.

The Administrative Procedure Act requires the
publication of notices of proposed delegation agreements
in the Register. A delegation agreement is an agreement
between an agency and a political subdivision that
authorizes the political subdivision to exercise functions,
powers, or duties conferred on the delegating agency by a
provision of law.

Delegation agreements are not intergovernmental
agreements pursuant to A.R.S. Title 11, Chapter 7, Article 3.
For at least 30 days after publication of the Notice of
Proposed Delegation Agreement in the Register, the agency
shall provide persons the opportunity to submit in writing
statements, arguments, data, and views on the proposed
delegation agreement and shall provide an opportunity for a
public hearing if there is sufficient interest. The delegating
agency shall follow the procedures for delegation
agreements specified in A.R.S. Title 41, Chapter 6, Article 8.

NOTICE OF PROPOSED DELEGATION AGREEMENT

[M15-294]

The name of the political subdivision to which functions. powers and duties of the agency are proposed to be

1. Name of the agency proposing the delegation agreement:
Arizona Department of Environmental Quality
2.
delegated:
Gila County
3.

comments:

The name, address. and telephone number of agency personnel to whom persons may direct questions or

Approvals of Drinking Water Systems, Subdivisions, On-Site Wastewater Treatment Facilities and Sewage Collection

Systems; Private Residential Gray Water

Name: Jerry Smit, Manager, Groundwater Section
Address: Arizona Department of Environmental Quality
1110 W. Washington St.
Phoenix, AZ 85007
Phone: (602) 771-4827
E-mail: jhs@azdeq.gov

4. A summary of the delegation agreement and the subjects and issues involved:

Under A.R.S. § 49-107, the Arizona Department of Environmental Quality proposes to amend the delegation agree-
ment with Gila County, the Local Agency (LA). The proposed delegation agreement makes the following changes:

*  Changes delegation from county community development department to county public health and emergency

services, environmental health department

*  Changes Primary Contact to Director of county public health and emergency services, environmental health

department for Appendix A and Appendix B

*  Updates state Agency contact person for Waste Inspections & Compliance Section

All other delegated program elements remain the same as the current delegation agreement.

5. Copies of the proposed delegation agreement may be obtained from the agency as follows:
An electronic copy of the existing Agreement may be downloaded from the following web site address:

http://azdeq.gov/function/permits/delegated.html

Or contact:

Sherri Zendri, Administrative Counsel

Arizona Department of Environmental Quality

Office of Administrative Counsel
1110 W. Washington
Phoenix, AZ 85007

(602) 771-2242
slz@azdeq.gov

Telephone:
E-mail:

6. The schedule of public hearings on the proposed delegation agreement:
Where there is sufficient public interest, ADEQ will hold a public hearing to receive public comments, in accor-

dance with A.R.S. § 41-1081. The time, place, and location of the hearings will be provided in the corresponding
Notice of Public Hearing pursuant to A.A.C. R18-1-401 and R18-1-402.

2984

Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



e/

Arizona Administrative REGISTER Proposed Delegation Agreements 1 _

ADEQ accepts written statements, arguments, data, and views on the proposed delegation agreement that are
received within 30 days after the date of the publication of this notice in the Register by 5:00 p.m. or postmarked
not later than that date.

After the conclusion of the public comment period and hearing, if any, the agency shall prepare a written summary
responding to the comments received, whether oral or written. The agency shall consider the comments received
from the public in determining whether to enter into the proposed delegation agreement. The agency shall give
written notice to those persons who submitted comments of the agency’s decision on whether to enter into the pro-
posed delegation agreement.

November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48 2985



e/

_—

i

Notices of Substantive Policy Statement Arizona Administrative REGISTER

NOTICES OF SUBSTANTIVE POLICY STATEMENT

The Administrative Procedure Act (APA) requires the procedures of the agency and does not impose additional

publication of Notices of Substantive Policy Statement requirements or penalties on regulated parties or include

issued by agencies (A.R.S. § 41-1013(B)(14)). confidential information or rules made in accordance with the
Substantive policy statements are written expressions  APA.

which inform the general public of an agency’s current If you believe that a substantive policy statement does

approach to rule or regulation practice. impose additional requirements or penalties on regulated

Substantive policy statements are advisory only. A parties you may petition the agency under A.R.S. § 41-1033

substantive policy statement does not include internal for a review of the statement.
procedural documents that only affect the internal

=

[

[

[+

[

[

[~

NOTICE OF SUBSTANTIVE POLICY STATEMENT

DEPARTMENT OF INSURANCE
[M15-292]

Subject of the substantive policy statement and the substantive policy statement number by which the policy
statement is referenced:
Notification of Change of Department Procedure (Regulatory Bulletin 2015-06).

Date the substantive policy statement was issued and the effective date of the policy statement if different from
the issuance date:
The substantive policy statement was issued November 4, 2015.

Summary of the content of the substantive policy statement:
The Regulatory Bulletin advises all surety insurers that engage bail bond agents to post appearance (bail) bonds in

Arizona courts of a change of procedure within the Department.

Federal or state constitutional provision;: federal or state statute, administrative rule, or regulation: or final court
judgment that underlies the substantive policy statement:

AR.S. §§ 20-286(C), 20-340.03(A)(6), 20-340.06, and 33-804.
A.A.C. R20-6-601(e)(4)(b) and (c)

A statement as to whether the substantive policy statement is a new statement or a revision:
This is a new statement.

The name. address. and telephone number of the person to whom questions and comments about the substantive
policy statement may be directed:
Name: Mary Kosinski
Address: Arizona Department of Insurance
2910 N. 44th St., Suite 210
Phoenix, AZ 85018-7269

E-mail: mkosinski@azinsurance.gov
Telephone: (602) 364-3471
Information about where a person may obtain a copy of the substantive policy statement:

Copies of this policy are available via the internet at http://insurance.az.gov or from the person listed in question #6
for 25 cents per page.

2986 Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



e/

_{_ Notices of Agency Ombudsman Arizona Administrative REGISTER

NOTICES OF AGENCY OMBUDSMAN

The Administrative Procedure Act requires the assist members of the public or regulated community in
publication of Notices of Agency Ombudsman. Agencies seeking information or assistance from the agency. (A.R.S. §
shall publish annually in the Register the name or names 41-1006)
of those employees who are designated by the agency to

NOTICE OF AGENCY OMBUDSMAN

ARIZONA LOTTERY
[M15-293]
1. The agency name: Arizona Lottery
2. The ombudsman’s:
a. Name: Brian Townsend
b. Title: Deputy Director
¢. Specific agency division, if applicable: NA
3. The ombudsman’s office address to include the city. state and zip code:
Arizona Lottery
4740 E. University Dr.
Phoenix, AZ 85034
4. The ombudsman’s area code and telephone number. fax number and e-mail address. if available:
Telephone: (480) 921-4437
Fax: (480) 921-4488
E-mail: btownsend@azlottery.gov

November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48 2987



¥

/3\% Governor Executive Orders Arizona Administrative REGISTER

GOVERNOR EXECUTIVE ORDERS

The Administrative Procedure Act (APA) requires the  In addition, the Register shall include each statement filed by
full-text publication of Governor Executive Orders. the Governor in granting a commutation, pardon or reprieve,
With the exception of egregious errors, content Or stay or suspension of execution where a sentence of
(including spelling, grammar, and punctuation) of these death is imposed.
orders has been reproduced as submitted.

EXECUTIVE ORDER 2015-07

Authorization to Arm Designated Members of the Arizona National Guard
[M15-310]
WHEREAS, on July 16, 2015, an act of terrorism directed at military personnel at the military recruitment and readiness
centers in Chattanooga, Tennessee resulted in the deaths of four United States Marines and one Navy Petty Officer; and

WHEREAS, there have been multiple domestic instances of terrorist acts and intended acts against members of the U.S.
Military, including but not limited to the 2009 attack at Fort Hood, Texas, against U.S. service members who were going
through medical in-processing prior to overseas deployment, which resulted in 13 deaths and 32 people wounded; and

WHEREAS, in each of these cases, the perpetrator of the terrorist acts likely understood that his intended military victims
were unarmed and therefore presented “soft targets;” and

WHEREAS, the brave men and women of the Arizona National Guard — Soldiers and Airmen who protect the residents of
this State and the United States of America — are entitled to at least the same level of self-defense as other residents of this
State; and

WHEREAS, Article V, Section 3 of the Arizona Constitution and A.R.S. §§ 26-101(C) and 26-102(A) establish the
Governor as the commander-in-chief of the military forces of the State, including the Arizona National Guard; and

WHEREAS, A.R.S. § 26-102(D)(8) directs the Adjutant General of the Arizona National Guard, with the approval of the
Governor, to adopt methods of security for the national guard reservations or facilities;

NOW, THEREFORE I, Douglas A. Ducey, Governor of the State of Arizona, by virtue of the authority vested in me by the
Constitution and Laws of the State, do hereby direct the Adjutant General of the Arizona National Guard as follows:

A. Identify and arm all appropriately trained National Guard personnel who he determines reasonably necessary, based
upon their duty positions, responsibilities, or locations, to protect themselves and other persons from the threat of
deadly physical force;

B. Institute a policy and training requirements that permit National Guard personnel to carry personally owned hand-
guns while on duty at a secured facility or military installation, in lieu of a government-issued handgun, as specified
by the Adjutant General. This policy should allow National Guard personnel to carry these handguns on unsecured
facilities while on duty if a government-issued handgun is not reasonably accessible;

C. Consult with the Director of the Arizona Department of Public Safety to review the security measures and protocols
in place at Arizona National Guard facilities, including without limitation recruiting offices, and make any recom-
mendations necessary to further protect Soldiers, Airmen, and the public against attacks on military personnel.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and caused to be
affixed the Great Seal of the State of Arizona

Douglas A. Ducey
GOVERNOR

DONE at the Capitol in Phoenix on this Twenty-Second day of July in the Year
Two Thousand Fifteen and of the independence of the United States of
America the Two Hundred and Fortieth.

2988 Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



. e
Arizona Administrative REGISTER Governor Executive Orders 1

ATTEST:
Michele Reagan
Secretary of State

EXECUTIVE ORDER 2015-08

The Governor’s Council on Child Safety and Family Empowerment
(Superseding Executive Order 2014-06)
[M15-311]
WHEREAS, strong families and youth are the future of Arizona and are of vital importance to our communities and
economy; and

WHEREAS, the need to support families and youth, especially Arizona’s most vulnerable (those most likely to enter into or
are in the care of the State) is of the utmost urgency; and

WHEREAS, government has an important but limited role in providing benefits, goods and services, recognizing the need
to collaborate with faith-based and private sector partners to solve community challenges; and

WHEREAS, Arizona’s public, charitable, faith-based and business communities have successfully provided support and
services to families and youth; and

WHEREAS, the state’s future well-being is intrinsically linked to the cooperative and collaborative engagement of public,
charitable, faith-based and business communities in providing opportunities to develop all families and youth to their fullest
potential with a particular emphasis on those children that may end up in the care of the State.

NOW, THEREFORE, I, Douglas A. Ducey, by virtue of the authority vested in me by the Arizona Constitution and laws of
the State of Arizona do hereby order and direct as follows:

*  The Governor’s Council on Child Safety and Family Empowerment is hereby created to align, leverage and coordi-
nate faith-based and community resources to solve challenges faced by our most vulnerable children and families
within the child welfare system and to provide additional support to strengthen families that are caring for both fos-
ter and adopted children.

*  Members of the Council shall be appointed by, and serve without compensation at the pleasure of the Gover-
nor. To the extent practicable, the members of the Council shall reflect the geographic, cultural and religious
diversity of the State.

*  The Governor shall appoint Co-Chairs of the Council.

*  The Office may accept monies from local, state or federal government sources, other public agencies, or non-
governmental organizations, and monies donated or awarded by any other entities. The monies shall be
expended solely for the purposes provided in this Executive Order Purpose and accounted for as provided by
law.

*  The Council, in alliance with the Governor’s Office of Youth, Faith and Family shall:

*  Prepare and update annually a strategic plan.

*  Conduct local outreach to develop a comprehensive and inclusive state service plan and coordinate with exist-
ing programs to prevent duplication of effort.

*  Develop partnerships between the state, faith-based organizations and community entities in order to ulti-
mately decrease the number of children being placed in the child welfare system by facilitating and providing
support for Prevention services, as well as supporting recruitment to increase the number of foster and adoptive
families, and aiding in the support of existing foster and adoptive families.

* Bring attention to exemplar programs that provide innovative examples for effective family and youth pro-
gramming.

*  Prepare an annual progress report for submission to the Governor by June 30 of each year.

*  This Executive Order shall supersede Executive Order 2014-06, and will integrate the family and youth-focused
work of the Arizona Council on Faith and Community Partnerships.

*  The Governor’s Office of Youth, Faith and Family shall serve as the lead agency for administration of the Council
as is deemed appropriate and necessary to fulfill the objectives of this Order. Additionally, all state agencies shall

November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48 2989



¥

/3\% Governor Executive Orders Arizona Administrative REGISTER

provide reasonable assistance to the Council as requested to ensure a fully coordinated state effort for promoting
Arizona’s families and youth.

*  The Governor’s Council on Child Safety and Family Empowerment shall be reviewed no later than June 30, 2020,
to determine appropriate action for its continuance, modification or termination.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and caused to be
affixed the Great Seal of the State of Arizona.

Douglas A. Ducey
GOVERNOR

DONE at the Capitol in Phoenix on this Thirtieth day of July in the year Two
Thousand and Fifteen and of the Independence of the United States of America
the Two Hundred and Fortieth.

ATTEST:

Michele Reagan

Secretary of State

EXECUTIVE ORDER 2015-10

The Workforce Arizona Council
(Superseding Executive Order 2008-17)
[M15-312]
WHEREAS, the future of Arizona and the economic opportunities available to its residents depend on the ability of
Arizona’s businesses and workforce to compete in the global economy; and

WHEREAS, workforce development requires a partnership among the business community, educational institutions, and
certain government agencies to effectively educate and prepare the workforce for in-demand careers; and

WHEREAS, a coordinated and strategic effort of workforce development activities should be implemented to optimize our
effectiveness and give Arizona a competitive edge; and

WHEREAS, to further these goals, the Workforce Arizona Council should be created to (i) bring together a broad range of
stakeholders representing industries vital to Arizona’s continued economic development, (ii) provide state-level
coordination of workforce development policies and programs, (iii) establish goals for the development of a state plan, and
(iv) make recommendations to the Governor on the effective use of resources.

NOW, THEREFORE, I, Douglas A. Ducey, Governor of the State of Arizona, by virtue of the authority vested in me by
the Constitution and laws of the State of Arizona, hereby order as follows:

*  The Workforce Arizona Council (WAC) shall be established in accordance with the Workforce Innovation and
Opportunity Act (WIOA), 29 U.S.C. § 3111, and A.R.S. § 41-1542.

*  Membership of the WAC shall be consistent with the requirements of the WIOA, 29 U.S.C. § 3111, and A.R.S. §
41-1542 and shall consist of:

*  The Governor of the State of Arizona, or his designee;

* A member of each chamber of the Arizona State Legislature, appointed by the appropriate presiding officers of
such chamber;

*  Other members who shall be appointed by the Governor pursuant to the requirements set forth in the WIOA, 29
U.S.C. § 3111(b)(1)(C), and A.R.S. § 41-1542.

*  The WAC shall include members who represent diverse geographic areas of the State of Arizona.

*  The Governor shall select a chairperson for the WAC from among the members who are representatives of
businesses in the State.

*  Members of the WAC shall serve at the pleasure of the appointing person.
*  Appointments to the WAC shall be for three-year terms.

*  The WAC may create subcommittees, appointed by the chairperson. Subcommittee members may include indi-
viduals from the general public who have specialized knowledge and experience to be of assistance to the
WAC.

2990 Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



. e
Arizona Administrative REGISTER Governor Executive Orders 1

This Executive Order shall take effect immediately.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, 1 have hereunto set my hand and caused to be
affixed the Great Seal of the State of Arizona.

Douglas A. Ducey
GOVERNOR

DONE at the Capitol in Phoenix on this Seventeenth day of November in the
year Two Thousand and Fifteen and of the Independence of the United States
of America the Two Hundred and Fortieth.

ATTEST:

Michele Reagan

Secretary of State

EXECUTIVE ORDER 2015-01
Internal Review of Administrative Rules; Moratorium to Promote Job Creation and
Customer-Service-Oriented Agencies

Editor’s Note: This Executive Order is being reproduced in each issue of the Administrative Register until its expiration
on December 31, 2015, as a notice to the public regarding state agencies’ rulemaking activities.
[M15-02]
WHEREAS, Arizona has lost more jobs per capita than any other state and has yet to recover all of those jobs;

WHEREAS, burdensome regulations inhibit job growth and economic development;

WHEREAS, each agency of the State of Arizona should promote customer-service-oriented principles for the people that it
serves;

WHEREAS, each State agency should undertake a critical and comprehensive review of its administrative rules and take
action to reduce the regulatory burden, administrative delay, and legal uncertainty associated with government regulation;

WHEREAS, overly burdensome, antiquated, contradictory, redundant, and nonessential regulations should be repealed,

WHEREAS, Article 5, Section 4 of the Arizona Constitution and Title 41, Chapter 1, Article 1 of the Arizona Revised
Statutes vests the executive power of the State of Arizona in the Governor;

NOW, THEREFORE, I, Douglas A. Ducey, by virtue of the authority vested in me by the Constitution and laws of the
State of Arizona hereby declare the following:

1. A State agency, subject to this Order, shall not conduct any rulemaking except as permitted by this Order.

2. A State agency, subject to this Order, shall not conduct any rulemaking, whether informal or formal, without the
prior written approval of the Office of the Governor. In seeking approval, a State agency shall address one or more
of the following as justification for the rulemaking:

a. To fulfill an objective related to job creation, economic development, or economic expansion in this State.

b. To reduce or ameliorate a regulatory burden while achieving the same regulatory objective.

c. To prevent a significant threat to the public health, peace or safety.

d. To avoid violating a court order or federal law that would result in sanctions by a court or the federal
government against an agency for failure to conduct the rulemaking action.

e. To comply with a federal statutory or regulatory requirement if such compliance is related to a condition for the
receipt of federal funds or participation in any federal program.

f.  To fulfill an obligation related to fees or any other action necessary to implement the State budget that is
certified by the Governor’s Office of Strategic Planning and Budgeting.

g. To promulgate a rule or other item that is exempt from Title 41, Chapter 6, Arizona Revised Statues, pursuant
to section 41-1005, Arizona Revised Statutes.

h. To address matters pertaining to the control, mitigation or eradication of waste, fraud, or abuse within an
agency or wasteful, fraudulent, or abusive activities perpetrated against an agency.

3. Paragraphs 1 and 2 apply to all State agencies, except for: (a) any State agency that is headed by a single elected
State official, (b) the Corporation Commission, or (c) any State agency whose agency head is not appointed by the
Governor. Those State agencies to which Paragraphs 1 and 2 do not apply are strongly encouraged to voluntarily
comply with this Order in the context of their own rulemaking processes.

November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48 2991



Governor Executive Orders Arizona Administrative REGISTER

Pursuant to Article 5, Section 4 of the Arizona Constitution and Arizona Revised Statutes Section 41-101(A)(1), the
State agencies identified in Paragraph 3 must provide the Office of the Governor with a written report for each
proposed rule 30 days prior to engaging in any rulemaking proceeding and must also provide the Office of the
Governor with a written report within 15 days of any rulemaking. The reports required by this Paragraph shall
explain, in detail, how the rulemaking advances the priorities and principles set forth in this Order.

No later than September 1, 2015, each State agency shall provide to the Office of the Governor an evaluation of
their rules, with recommendations for which rules could be amended or repealed consistent with the priorities and
principles set forth in this Order. The evaluation shall also include a summary of licensing time frames and describe
how those time frames compare to real processing time, and whether or not they can be reduced. Additionally, each
agency shall identify any existing licenses or permits in which a general permit could be used in lieu of an
individual permit, pursuant to Arizona Revised Statutes Section 41-1037.

No later than July 1, 2015, each State agency shall provide to the Office of the Governor an update on divisions
where electronic reporting and payment are not implemented and a suggested plan for how to implement this
customer-service-oriented service.

This Order does not confer any legal rights upon any persons and shall not be used as a basis for legal challenges to
rules, approvals, permits, licenses or other actions or to any inaction of a State agency. For the purposes of this
Order, “person,” “rule” and “rulemaking” have the same meanings prescribed in Arizona Revised Statutes Section
41-1001.

This Executive Order expires on December 31, 2015.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and caused to be
affixed the Great Seal of the State of Arizona.

Douglas A. Ducey
GOVERNOR

DONE at the Capitol in Phoenix on this fifth day of January in the year Two
Thousand and Fifteen and of the Independence of the United States of America
the Two Hundred and Thirty-ninth.

ATTEST:
Michele Reagan
Secretary of State

2992

Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



_—

¥

1 Governor Proclamations Arizona Administrative REGISTER

=

GOVERNOR PROCLAMATIONS

The Administrative Procedure Act (APA) requires the publication of Governor proclamations of general applicability,

and ceremonial dedications issued by the Governor.

THANKSGIVING DAY
[M15-314]

WHEREAS, President George Washington, at the request of Congress, proclaimed the first national Thanksgiving
Day, November 26, 1789, as “a day of public thanksgiving and prayer to be observed by acknowledging with grateful
hearts the many signal favors of Almighty God”; and
WHEREAS, President Abraham Lincoln, in 1863, proclaimed the last Thursday of November as the annual date for
the national Thanksgiving Day; and
WHEREAS, on December 26, 1941, President Franklin Roosevelt signed a joint resolution of Congress changing the
national Thanksgiving Day from the last Thursday in November to the fourth Thursday.
WHEREAS, the State of Arizona designated its motto as Ditat Deus - God Enriches, which acknowledges the
blessings of God; and
WHEREAS, on Thanksgiving Day, Arizonans and all Americans come together to enjoy the fellowship of family and
friends with a feast that symbolizes the many blessings in our lives; and
WHEREAS, Thanksgiving is a time to gather in a spirit of gratitude with one another, and it is also an opportunity to
serve others and to share our prosperities with those in need; and
WHEREAS, as Arizonans, we pause to consider our good fortune as American citizens and residents of this great
State, and we are mindful of the heroic men and women, and their families, serving in our Armed Forces, especially
those serving abroad.
NOW, THEREFORE, I, Douglas A. Ducey, Governor of the State of Arizona, do proclaim November 26, 2015, as

THANKSGIVING DAY
and I further encourage all citizens to pray or reflect and give thanks for the rich blessings of our State and our Nation.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand
and caused to be affixed the Great Seal of the State of
Arizona

Douglas A. Ducey
GOVERNOR

DONE at the Capitol in Phoenix on this twenty-third day
of November in the year Two Thousand and Fifteen and of
the Independence of the United States of America the Two
Hundred and Fortieth.

ATTEST:

Michele Reagan

SECRETARY OF STATE

November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48 2993



. e
Arizona Administrative REGISTER Governor Proclamations _{_

VICTIMS’ BILL OF RIGHTS DAY
[M15-313]
WHEREAS, on Tuesday, November 6, 1990 the voters of Arizona passed an amendment to the Arizona Constitution that
enacted the Victims’ Bill of Rights (VBR) for crime victims;
WHEREAS, on November 27, 1990, the VBR became effective and established a new era of hope that the rights of victims
to justice and due process would be preserved and protected;

WHEREAS, this year marks the 25t Anniversary of the establishment of victims’ rights in Arizona;
WHEREAS, in the intervening 25 years, Arizona has become a transformational national leader in the enactment and
enforcement of the rights of crime victims;
WHEREAS, across Arizona dedicated victim advocates, law enforcement officers, prosecutors, and judges have been
faithful to these constitutional rights;
WHEREAS, despite these significant gains, challenges remain to protect the rights of victims to justice and due process,
among others, the rights to a speedy trial and to be heard at all critical stages, and renewed efforts must be made to preserve
and protect all rights for crime victims; and
WHEREAS, the victims’ rights enjoyed by Arizonans should be the birthright of every person in the United States;
NOW, THEREFORE, I, Douglas A. Ducey, Governor of Arizona, hereby proclaim November 27, 2015 as
VICTIMS’ BILL OF RIGHTS DAY
and:

1. Call on all Arizonans to celebrate with thanks the passage of the Victims’ Bill of Rights;

2. Call on all those in the criminal justice system to fully and fairly enforce all the rights of crime victims; and

3. Call on the Congress to send to the States for ratification an amendment to the U.S. Constitution to establish rights

for all crime victims.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand
and caused to be affixed the Great Seal of the State of
Arizona

Douglas A. Ducey
GOVERNOR

DONE at the Capitol in Phoenix on this twenty-third day
of November in the year Two Thousand and Fifteen and of
the Independence of the United States of America the Two
Hundred and Fortieth.

ATTEST:

Michele Reagan

SECRETARY OF STATE

2994 Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



_—

¥

1 Indexes

Arizona Administrative REGISTER

REGISTER INDEXES

The Register is published by volume in a calendar year (See “Information” in the front of each issue for a more detailed
explanation).

Abbreviations for rulemaking activity in this Index include:

PROPOSED RULEMAKING

PN = Proposed new Section

PM = Proposed amended Section
PR = Proposed repealed Section

P# = Proposed renumbered Section

SUPPLEMENTAL PROPOSED RULEMAKING

SPN = Supplemental proposed new Section

SPM = Supplemental proposed amended Section
SPR = Supplemental proposed repealed Section
SP# = Supplemental proposed renumbered Section
FINAL RULEMAKING

FN = Final new Section

FM = Final amended Section

FR = Final repealed Section

F# = Final renumbered Section

SUMMARY RULEMAKING

PROPOSED SUMMARY

PSMN = Proposed Summary new Section
PSMM = Proposed Summary amended Section
PSMR = Proposed Summary repealed Section
PSM# = Proposed Summary renumbered Section

FINAL SUMMARY

FSMN = Final Summary new Section

FSMM = Final Summary amended Section
FSMR = Final Summary repealed Section
FSM# = Final Summary renumbered Section
EXPEDITED RULEMAKING

PROPOSED EXPEDITED

PEN = Proposed Expedited new Section
PEM = Proposed Expedited amended Section
PER = Proposed Expedited repealed Section

PE# = Proposed Expedited renumbered Section
SUPPLEMENTAL EXPEDITED

SPEN = Supplemental Proposed Expedited new Section

SPEM = Supplemental Proposed Expedited amended Section
SPER = Supplemental Proposed Expedited repealed Section
SPE# = Supplemental Proposed Expedited renumbered Section
FINAL EXPEDITED

FEN = Final Expedited new Section

FEM = Final Expedited amended Section
FER = Final Expedited repealed Section
FE# = Final Expedited renumbered Section

EXEMPT RULEMAKING

EXEMPT PROPOSED

PXN = Proposed Exempt new Section

PXM = Proposed Exempt amended Section

PXR = Proposed Exempt repealed Section

PX# = Proposed Exempt renumbered Section

EXEMPT SUPPLEMENTAL PROPOSED

SPXN = Supplemental Proposed Exempt new Section
SPXR = Supplemental Proposed Exempt repealed Section
SPXM= Supplemental Proposed Exempt amended Section
SPX# = Supplemental Proposed Exempt renumbered Section
FINAL EXEMPT RULMAKING

FXN = Final Exempt new Section

FXM = Final Exempt amended Section

FXR = Final Exempt repealed Section

FX# = Final Exempt renumbered Section
EMERGENCY RULEMAKING

EN = Emergency new Section

EM = Emergency amended Section

ER = Emergency repealed Section

E# = Emergency renumbered Section

EEXP = Emergency expired

RECODIFICATION OF RULES
RC = Recodified

REJECTION OF RULES

RJ = Rejected by the Attorney General
TERMINATION OF RULES

TN = Terminated proposed new Sections

TM = Terminated proposed amended Section
TR = Terminated proposed repealed Section

T# = Terminated proposed renumbered Section
RULE EXPIRATIONS

EXP = Rules have expired

See also “emergency expired” under emergency rulemaking

CORRECTIONS
C = Corrections to Published Rules

November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48

2995



Arizona Administrative REGISTER

Indexes

¥
AL

2015 Arizona Administrative Register

Volume 21 Page Guide

Issue 1, Jan. 2, 2015

Issue 2, Jan. 9, 2015 ............... 47-112
Issue 3, Jan. 16, 2015........... 113-152
Issue 4, Jan. 23,2015 ........... 153-172
Issue 5, Jan. 30, 2015 ........... 173-196
Issue 6, Feb. 6, 2015.............. 197-228
Issue 7, Feb. 13, 2015.... 229-262
Issue 8, Feb. 20, 2015............. 263-284
Issue 9, Feb. 27, 2015............. 285-320

Issue 10, March 6, 2015.......... 321-374
Issue 11, March 13, 2015........ 375-406
Issue 12, March 20, 2015........ 407-432
Issue 13, March 27, 2015........ 433-482
Issue 14, April 3, 2015............ 483-516
Issue 15, April 10, 2015.......... 517-538
Issue 16, April 17, 2015.......... 539-566

Issue 17, April 24, 2015.......... 567-606

Issue 18, Mayl, 2015............... 607-632
Issue 19, May 8, 2015.............. 633-666
Issue 20, May 15, 2015............ 667-706
Issue 21, May 22, 2015............ 707-742
Issue 22, May 29, 2015............ 743-774
Issue 23, June 5, 2015.............. 775-818
Issue 24, June 12, 2015............. 819-864
Issue 25, June 19, 2015............. 865-916
Issue 26, June 26, 2015............. 917-954
Issue 27, July 3, 2015................. 955-996
Issue 28, July 10, 2015............... 997-1072

Issue 29, July 17, 2015 1073-1146

Issue 30, July 24, 2015............. 1147-1220
Issue 31, July 31, 2015......... 1221-1457
Issue 32, Aug. 7, 2015.......... 1458-1520

Issue 33, Aug. 14, 2015........ 1521-1622
Issue 34, Aug. 21, 2015........ 1623-1670
Issue 35, Aug. 28, 2015........ 1671-1760
Issue 36, Sept. 4, 2015.......... 1761-1810
Issue 37, Sept. 11, 2015........ 1811-1882
Issue 38, Sept. 18, 2015........ 1883-2004
Issue 39, Sept. 25, 2015......... 2005-2104
Issue 40, Oct. 2, 2015............ 2105-2276
Issue 41, Oct. 9, 2015............ 2277-2340
Issue 42, Oct. 16, 2015.......... 2341-2440
Issue 43, Oct. 23, 2015.......... 2441-2502
Issue 44, Oct. 30, 2015.......... 2503-2592
Issue 45, Nov. 6, 2015........... 2593-2706
Issue 46, Nov. 13, 2015......... 2707-2808
Issue 47, Nov. 20, 2015......... 2809-2966

RULEMAKING ACTIVITY INDEX

Rulemakings are listed in the Index by Chapter, Section number, rulemaking activity abbreviation and by volume page
number. Use the page guide above to determine the Register issue number to review the rule. Headings for the
Subchapters, Articles, Parts, and Sections are not indexed.

THIS INDEX INCLUDES RULEMAKING ACTIVITY THROUGH ISSUE 47 OF VOLUME 21.

Agriculture, Department of - Animal R9-22-730. PXM-5; R4-6-205. FXM-2630
Services Division PXM-491; R4-6-206. FXM-2630
R3-2-203. FXM-2404 FXM-637; R4-6-207. FXM-2630
R3-2-701. FXM-2404 PXM-1041; R4-6-208. FXM-2630
R3-2-801. FXM-2407 FXM-1486 R4-6-209. FXM-2630
R3-2-810. FXM-2404 R9-22-1001. FM-1237 R4-6-210. FXR-2630;
R3-2-811. FXM-2407 R9-22-1002. FM-1237 FXN-2630
Agriculture, Department of - Environ- R9-22-1003.  FM-1237 R4-6-211. FXM-2630
mental Services Division R9-22-1202.  FM-1225 R4-6-212. FXM-2630
R3-3-101. PM-2345 R9-22-1301.  PM-823; R4-6-212.01.  FXN-2630
Table 1. PM-2345 FM-2022 R4-6-213. FX#-2630;
R3-3-201. PM-2345 R9-22-1303.  PM-823; FXN-2630
R3-3-202. PM-2345 FM-2022 R4-6-214. FX#-2630;
R3-3-208. PM-2345 R9-22-1304.  PM-823; FXN-2630
R3-3-305. PM-2345 FM-2022 R4-6-215. FX#-2630;
R3-3-401. PM-2345 R9-22-1431.  FR-1241 FXM-2630
R3-3-402. PM-2345 Arizona Health Care Cost Containment R4-6-216. FX#-2630;
R3-3-502. PM-2345 System - Arizona Long-term Care Sys- FXM-2630
Agriculture, Department of - Office of tem
Commodity Development and Promo- R9-28-202 PM-487: R4-6-301. FXM-2630
tion -28-202. A Table 1. FXM-2630
R3-6-102. FXM-2412 RO28.206.  PM.487- ApEvey 200
Agriculture, Department of - Plant Ser- FM-12 43 R4-6_304. FXM- 2630
vices Division . . -o= . "
R3-4-301. FXM-2410 Beha}sil;‘)-rg_lll-étlealth Exanlzl)lzizs_,zlzg%rd of R4-6-305. FXM-2630
Arizona Health Care Cost Containment R4-6-201 ’ FXM-2630 R4-6-306. FXM-2630
System - Administration : R4-6-307. FXR-2630;
R9-22-202. FM-1225 R4-6-202. FXR-2630 FXN-2630
R9-22-712.05.  PM-1815 R4-6-203. FXM-2630 R4-6-401. FXM-2630
R9-22-712.07. PM-1768 R4-6-204. FXR-2630 R4-6-402. FXM-2630
2996 Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



¥

1 Indexes

_—

Arizona Administrative REGISTER

R4-6-403. FXM-2630 R4-5-201. PM-869; R21-1-203. FXN-2554
R4-6-404. FXM-2630 FM-2528 R21-1-204. FXN-2554
R4-6-405. FXR-2630 R4-5-202. PM-869; R21-1-205. FXN-2554
R4-6-501. FXM-2630 FM-2528 R21-1-206. FXN-2554
R4-6-502. FXM-2630 R4-5-203. PM-869; R21-1-207. FXN-2554
R4-6-503. FXM-2630 FM-2528 R21-1-208. FXN-2554
R4-6-504. FXM-2630 R4-5-204. P#-869; R21-1-209. FXN-2554
R4-6-505. FXR-2630 F#-2528 R21-1-210. FXN-2554
R4-6-601. FXM-2630 R4-5-301. PM-869; R21-1-211. FXN-2554
R4-6-602. EM-521; FM-2528 R21-1-212. FXN-2554
FXM-2630 R4-5-302. PM-869; R21-1-213. FXN-2554
R4-6-603. FXM-2630 FM-2528 R21-1-301. FXN-2554
R4-6-604. FXM-2630 R4-5-303. PM-869; R21-1-302. FXN-2554
R4-6-605. FXM-2630 FM-2528 R21-1-303. FXN-2554
R4-6-606. FXR-2630 R4-5-304. PM-869; R21-1-304. FXN-2554
R4-6-701. FXM-2630 FM-2528 R21-1-305. FXN-2554
R4-6-702. FXM-2630 R4-5-305. PN-869; R21-1-306. FXN-2554
R4-6-703. FXM-2630 FN-2528 R21-1-307. FXN-2554
R4-6-704. FXM-2630 R4-5-401. PM-869; R21-1-308. FXN-2554
R4-6-705. FXM-2630 FM-2528 R21-1-309. FXN-2554
R4-6-706. FXM-2630 R4-5-402. PM-869; R21-1-310. FXN-2554
R4-6-707. FXR-2630; FM-2528 R21-1-311. FXN-2554
FXN-2630 R4-5-403. PM-869; R21-1-312. FXN-2554
R4-6-801. FXM-2630 FM-2528 R21-1-313. FXN-2554
R4-6-802. FXM-2630 R4-5-404. PM-869; R21-1-314. FXN-2554
R4-6-803. FXM-2630 FM-2528 R21-1-401. FXN-2554
R4-6-804. FXR-2630 R4-5-405. PM-869; R21-1-402. FXN-2554
R4-6-901. FXM-2630 FM-2528 R21-1-403. FXN-2554
R4-6-902. FXM-2630 Exhibit 1. PM-869 R21-1-404. FXN-2554
R4-6-1001. FXM-2630 Exhibit 2. PM-869 R21-1-405. FXN-2554
R4-6-1002. FXM-2630 R4-5-406. PM-869; R21-1-406. FXN-2554
R4-6-1101. FXM-2630 FM-2528 R21-1-501. FXN-2554
R4-6-1102. FXM-2630 R4-5-407. PM-869; R21-1-502. FXN-2554
R4-6-1103. FXM-2630 FM-2528 R21-1-503. FXN-2554
R4-6-1104. FXM-2630 R4-5-408. PM-869; R21-1-504. FXN-2554
R4-6-1105. FXM-2630 FM-2528 R21-1-505. FXN-2554
R4-6-1106. FXN-2630 R4-5-409. PM-869; R21-1-506. FXN-2554
Barbers, Board of FM-2528 R21-1-507. FXN-2554
R4-5-101. PM-869; R4-5-410. PR-869; R21-1-508. FXN-2554
FM-2528 FR-2528 Clean Elections Commission, Citizens
R4-5-102. PM-869; R4-5-411. PM-869; R2-20-107. PXM-779;
FM-2528 FM-2528 FXM-1627
R4-5-103. PM-869; R4-5-501. PM-869; R2-20-109. PXM-781;
FM-2528 FM-2528 PXM-1977;
R4-5-104. PM-869; R4-5-502. PM-869; PXM-2043
FM-2528 FM-2528 R2-20-110. PXM-785;
R4-5-105. PR-869; Child Safety, Department of - Adminis- FXM-1629
FR-2528 tration R2-20-111. PXM-787,
R4-5-106. PM-869; R21-1-101. FXN-2554 FXM-1631
FM-2528 R21-1-102. FXN-2554 R2-20-113. PXN-789;
R4-5-107. PM-869; R21-1-103. FXN-2554 FXM-1633
FM-2528 R21-1-104. FXN-2554 R2-20-204. PXM-790;
R4-5-108. PM-869; R21-1-105. FXN-2554 FXM-1634
FM-2528 R21-1-106. FXN-2554 R2-20-205. PXM-831;
Table 1. PN-869; R21-1-107. FXN-2554 FXM-1636
FN-2528 R21-1-108. FXN-2554 R2-20-206. PXM-792;
R4-5-109. P#-869; R21-1-109. FXN-2554 FXM-1638;
PM-869; R21-1-110. FXN-2554 PXM-1981
F#-2528; R21-1-201. FXN-2554
FM-2528 R21-1-202. FXN-2554
November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48 2997



Arizona Administrative REGISTER

Indexes

¥
AL

R2-20-208. PXM-1772; R6-13-210. EXP-157 R7-2-1005. FXM-1525
PXM-1822; R6-13-211. EXP-157 R7-2-1006. FXM-1525
PXM-1983 R6-13-212. EXP-157 R7-2-1007. FXM-1525
R2-20-223. FXM-2921 R6-13-213. EXP-157 R7-2-1008. FXR-1525;
R2-20-402.01. PXM-833; R6-13-214. EXP-157 FXN-1525
FXM-1640 R6-13-215. EXP-157 R7-2-10009. FXR-1525
R2-20-703. PXM-834; R6-13-216. EXP-157 R7-2-1010. FXM-1525
FXM-1641 R6-13-302. EXP-157 R7-2-1011. FXN-1525
R2-20-704. PXM-836; R6-13-303. EXP-157 R7-2-1012. FXN-1525
FXM-1643 R6-13-304. EXP-157 R7-2-1013. FXN-1525
Collateral Pool, Statewide R6-13-305. EXP-157 R7-2-1014. FXN-1525
R2-14-101. FN-233 R6-13-306. EXP-157 R7-2-1015. FXN-1525
R2-14-102. FN-233 R6-13-308. EXP-157 R7-2-1016. FXN-1525
R2-14-103. FN-233 R6-13-309. EXP-157 R7-2-1018. FXN-1525
R2-14-104. FN-233 R6-13-310. EXP-157 R7-2-1021. FXM-1525
R2-14-105. FN-233 R6-13-311. EXP-157 R7-2-1022. FXM-1525
R2-14-106. FN-233 R6-13-312. EXP-157 R7-2-1023. FXM-1525
R2-14-107. FN-233 R6-13-313. EXP-157 R7-2-1024. FXM-1525
R2-14-108. FN-233 R6-13-314. EXP-157 R7-2-1025. FXM-1525
R2-14-109. FN-233 R6-13-314.01. EXP-157 R7-2-1026. FXM-1525
Contractors, Registrar of R6-13-317. EXP-157 R7-2-1027. FXM-1525
R4-9-102. PM-2507 R6-13-318. EXP-157 R7-2-1028. FXM-1525
C'orporation Commission - Fixed Utili- R6-13-319. EXP-157 R7-2-1029. FXM-1525
ties R6-13-320. EXP-157 R7-2-1030. FXM-1525
R14-2-1805.  FM-379 R6-13-321. EXP-157 R7-2-1031. FXM-1525
R14-2-1812. ~ FM-379 R6-13-1201.  EXP-157 R7-2-1032. FXM-1525
tC."rP"rat“’“ Commission - Transporta- R6-13-1202.  EXP-157 R7-2-1033. FXM-1525
ton R6-13-1203.  EXP-157 R7-2-1035. FXM-1525
ﬁ}j:g:%gg: gﬁ:g;ﬁ R6-13-1204.  EXP-157 R7-2-1036. FXM-1525
R14-5-204. PM-674 R6-13-1206. EXP-157 R7-2-1037. FXM-1525
R14-5-205. PM-674 R6-13-1209. EXP-157 R7-2-1041. FXM-1525
R14-5-207 PM-674 R6-13-1210. EXP-157 R7-2-1042. FXM-1525
Cosmetology. B(;ard of R6-13-1211. EXP-157 R7-2-1044. FXM-1525
RA-10-102. PM-1765 R6-13-1212.  EXP-157 R7-2-1045. FXM-1525
R4-10-107. PM-1765 Education, State Board of R7-2-1046. FXM-1525
R4-10-110. PM-1765 R7-2-205. FXM-1775 R7-2-1047. FXM-1525
Dental Examiners, State Board of R7-2-301. FXM-1778 R7-2-1048. FXM-1525
R4-11-201. ’ PM-1887 R7-2-302. FXM-1778 R7-2-1049. FXM-1525
R4-11-202. PM-1887 R7-2-307. FXM-1781 R7-2-1050. FXM-1525
R4-11-203. PM-1887 R7-2-308. FXM-1781 R7-2-1053. FXM-1525
R4-11-205. PM-1887 R7-2-604.01. FXM-2047 R7-2-1056. FXM-1525
R4-11-301. PM-1887 R7-§-ggj-8§- FXM-§827 R7-2-1057. FXM-1525
R4_11_302. PR_1887 R7— - . . FXM' 7 R7'2—1058. FXM—ISZS
R7-2-604.04. FXM-2047 R7-2-1061. FXM-1525
o0 e R7-2-607.  FXM-2054 R7-2-1062.  FXM-1525
RA-11.305. PM-1887 R7-2-610. FXM-2054 R7-2-1063. FXM-1525
RA-11-1202.  FM.921 R7-2-611. FXM-2056 R7-2-1066.  FXM-1525
RA-11.1701.  PM671 R7-2-612. FXM-2063 R7-2-1067. FXR-1525;
Economic Security, Department of - g;'g'g%i Eiﬁ'gg;g R7-2-1068 Eiﬂ' 11552255
State Assistance Programs —&= . - -2- . -
R6-13-201. ’ EXP-157 R7-2-617. FXM-2077 R7-2-1069. FXN-1525
R6-13-202. EXP-157 R7-2-701. FXM-1775 R7-2-1070. FXN-1525
R6-13-203. EXP-157 R7-2-703. FXM-1775 R7-2-1073. FXM-1525
R6-13-204. EXP-157 R7-2-809. FXN-1784 R7-2-1074. FXM-1525
R6-13-205. EXP-157 R7-2-1001. FXM-1525 R7-2-1075. FXM-1525
R6-13-206. EXP-157 R7-2-1002. FXM-1491; R7-2-1076. FXM-1525
R6-13-207. EXP-157 FXM-1525 R7-2-1078. FXM-1525
R6-13-208. EXP-157 R7-2-1003. FXM-1525 R7-2-1079. FXM-1525
R6-13-209. EXP-157 R7-2-1004. FXM-1525 R7-2-1080. FXM-1525
2998 Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



_—

¥

! Indexes

Arizona Administrative REGISTER

R7-2-1081. FXM-1525 R7-2-1169. FXM-1525 R18-14-301. FN-2597
R7-2-1083. FXM-1525 R7-2-1170. FXM-1525 R18-14-302. FN-2597
R7-2-1084. FXM-1525 R7-2-1181. FXM-1525 R18-14-303. FN-2597
R7-2-1085. FXM-1525 R7-2-1182. FXM-1525 Environmental Quality, Department of
R7-2-1086. FXM-1525 R7-2-1183. FXM-1525 - Safe Drinking Water
R7-2-1087. FXN-1525 R7-2-1184. FXM-1525 R18-4-102. PM-2286
R7-2-1091. FXR-1525 R7-2-1185. FXM-1525 R18-4-103. PM-2286
R7-2-1092. FXR-1525; R7-2-1191. FXM-1525 R18-4-105. PM-2286
FXN-1525 R7-2-1192. FXM-1525 RI18-4-121. PM-2286
R7-2-1093. FXM-1525 R7-2-1194. FXM-1525 R18-4-126. PN-2286
R7-2-1100. FXN-1525 R7-2-1195. FXM-1525 R18-4-210. PM-2286
R7-2-1101. FXM-1525 R7-2-1196. FXN-1525 Environmenta.l Quality, Department of
R7-2-1102. FXM-1525 Emergency and Military Affairs, - Water Pollution Control
R7-2-1103. FXM-1525 Department of - Division of Emergency R18-9-1002. FM-751
R7-2-1104. FXM-1525 Management R18-9-1015. = FM-751
R7-2-1105 FXM-1525 R8-2-101. PM-1151 Environmental Quality, Department of
R7-2-1106. FXN-1525 R8-2-102. PM-1151 - Water Quality Standards
R7-2-1107. FXN-1525 R8-2-103. PM-1151 RIS-11-106. PM-1895;
R7-2-1108. FXN-1525 R8-2-104. PM-1151 TM-1986
R7-2-1109. FXM-1525 R8-2-105. PM-1151 RIS-11-109. PM-1895;
. _ Environmental Quality, Department of TM-1986
R7-2-1110. FXM-1525 ) . .
- Air Pollution Control R18-11-110. PM-1895;
R7-2-1111. FXM-1525 1
R7-2-1112 FXM-1525 R18-2-210. FXM-1156 TM-1986

’ R18-2-333. FEM-2747 R18-11-112. PM-1895;
R7-2-1113. FXM-1525 TM-1986
R7-2-1114 FXM-1525 R18-2-610. FXM-1156 -

’ R18-2-610.01. FXM-1156 R18-11-115. PM-1895;
R7-2-1115. FXM-1525 TM-1986
R7-2-1116 FXR-1525 R18-2-610.02. FXN-1156 -

) R18-2-610.03. FXN-1156 R18-11-121. PM-1895;
R7-2-1117. FXM-1525 1
R7-2-1118 FXM-1525 R18-2-611. FXM-1156 _ TM-1986
R7-2-1119. FXR-1525- R18-2-611.01. FXM-1156 Appendix A.  PM-1895;

’ FXN-1525’ R18-2-611.02. FXN-1156 TM-1986

R18-2-611.03. FXN-1156 Appendix B.  PM-1895;
R7-2-1120. FXM-1525
R18-2-612. FXR-1156; TM-1986
R7-2-1121. FXM-1525 . .
FXN-1156 Appendix C.  PM-1895;
R7-2-1122. FXM-1525
R18-2-612.01 FXN-1156 TM-1986
R7-2-1123. FXM-1525 . . .
R18-2-613. FXR-1156; Editor s Note: The terminated
R7-2-1125. FXM-1525 FXN-1156 rulemaking action (TM) notated in the
R7-2-1131. FXM-1525 R18-2-613.01 FXN-1156 above sections is in reference to the Notice
R7-2-1141. FXM-1525 Appendix 2 ’ FXM-1156 of Proposed Rulemaking published at 20
R7-2-1142. FXM-1525 Rl%p 570l EMLLL A.AR. 3590, December 26, 2014.
R7-2-1143. FXM-1525 See _ . . o
R18-2-733. FR-711 Examiners of Nursing Care Institution
R7-2-1144. FXM-1525 R18-2-733.01. FR-711 Administrators and Assisted Living
R7-2-1145. FXM-1525 R18-2-734 FM-711 Facility Managers, Board of
R7-2-1146. FXM-1525 ) R4-33-101 FM-543
R18-2-901. FEM-2747 :
R7-2-1147. FXM-1525 R4-33-108 FM-543
R18-2-1101. FEM-2747 :
R7-2-1148. FXM-1525 . R4-33-203 FM-543
Appendix 2. FEM-2747 :
R7-2-1149. FXM-1525 . . R4-33-208. FM-543
Environmental Quality, Department of
R7-2-1150. FXM-1525 R4-33-212 FN-543
- Hazardous Waste Management :
R7-2-1151. FXM-1525 R18-8-260. FM-1246 R4-33-302. FM-543
R7-2-1153. FXM-1525 R18-8-262. FM-1246 R4-33-402. FM-543
R7-2-1155. FXM-1525 R18-8-263. FM-1246 R4-33-407. FM-543
R7-2-1157. FXM-1525 R18-8-265. FM-1246 R4-33-411. FN-543
R7-2-1158. FXM-1525 R18-8-266. FM-1246 Financial Institutions, Department of
R7-2-1159. FXM-1525 R18-8-268. FM-1246 R20-4-707. EXP-411
R7-2-1161. FXM-1525 R18-8-270 FM-1246 Financial Institutions, Department of -
R7-2-1164. FXM-1525 R18-8-271 ' FM-1246 Real Estate Appraisal Division
R7-2-1165. FXM-1525 P : R4-46-101. FM-1675
R18-8-273. FM-1246 R4-46-102 FM-1675
R7-2-1167. FXM-1525 Environmental Quality, Department of e i
R7-2-1168. FXM-1525 - Permit and Compliance Fees R4-46-103. FM-1675
November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48 2999



Arizona Administrative REGISTER

Indexes

¥
AL

R4-46-106. FM-1675 R12-4-124. PN-1001 R20-5-1304.  PN-2739
R4-46-107. FN-1675 R12-4-125. P#-1001; R20-5-1305.  PN-2739
R4-46-401. FR-1675; PM-1001 R20-5-1306.  PN-2739

FN-1675 R12-4-202. PM-747; R20-5-1307. PN-2739
R4-46-402. FN-1675 FM-2550 R20-5-1308.  PN-2739
R4-46-403. FN-1675 R12-4-302. PM-1001 R20-5-1309.  PN-2739
R4-46-404. FN-1675 R12-4-401. FM-2813 R20-5-1310.  PN-2739
R4-46-405. FN-1675 R12-4-402. FM-2813 R20-5-1311.  PN-2739
R4-46-406. FN-1675 R12-4-403. FM-2813 R20-5-1312.  PN-2739
R4-46-407. FN-1675 R12-4-404. FM-2813 Insurance, Department of
R4-46-408. FN-1675 R12-4-405. FM-2813 R20-6-1101. PM-2401
R4-46-501. FM-1675 R12-4-406. FM-2813 R20-6-1401.  FXM-54
R4-46-502. FN-1675 R12-4-407. FM-2813 R20-6-1402.  FXM-54
R4-46-503. FR-1675; R12-4-408. FM-2813 R20-6-1403.  FXM-54

FN-1675 R12-4-409. FM-2813 R20-6-1404. FXM-54
R4-46-504. FN-1675 R12-4-410. FM-2813 R20-6-1405. FXM-54
R4-46-505. FN-1675 R12-4-411. FM-2813 R20-6-1406.  FXM-54
R4-46-506. FN-1675 R12-4-412. FM-2813 R20-6-1407.  FXM-54
R4-46-507. FN-1675 R12-4-413. FM-2813 R20-6-1408.  FXR-54;
R4-46-508. FN-1675 R12-4-414. FM-2813 FXN-54
R4-46-509. FN-1675 R12-4-415. FR-2813 R20-6-1409. FXN-54
R4-46-510. FN-1675 R12-4-416. FR-2813 R20-6-1410. FXN-54
R4-46-511. FN-1675 R12-4-417. FM-2813 Appendix A.  FXM-54
R4-46-601. FM-1675 R12-4-418. FM-2813 Appendix B.  FXM-54
R4-46-602. FR-1675 R12-4-419. FR-2813 Appendix C.  FXM-54

Fingerprinting, Board of R12-4-420. FM-2813 Appendix D. FXM-54
R13-11-101.  EXP-465 R12-4-421. FM-2813 Appendix E.  FX#-54;

Fire, Building and Life Safety, Depart- R12-4-422. FM-2813 FXM-54;

ment of R12-4-423. FM-2813 FXN-54
R4-36-201. PM-1077 R12-4-424. FM-2813 Appendix . FXN-54
R4-36-301. PM-1077 R12-4-425. FM-2813 Appendix G FX#-54;
R4-36-302. PM-1077 R12-4-426. FM-2813 FXM-54;
R4-36-303. PM-1077 R12-4-427. FM-2813 FXN-54
R4-36-304. PM-1077 R12-4-428. FM-2813 R20-6-1601. FXM-2448
R4-36-305. PM-1077 R12-4-430. FM-2813 R20-6-1602. FX#-2448;
R4-36-307. PM-1077 R12-4-504. FXM-1046 FXN-2448
R4-36-308. PM-1077 R12-4-611. PM-1001 R20-6-1603.  FX#-2448;
R4-36-309. PM-1077 R12-4-804. P#-1001 FXN-2448
R4-36-310. PM-1077 R12-4-901. EXP-757 R20-6-1604.  FX#-2448;
R4-36-311. PR-1077 R12-4-902. EXP-757 FXN-2448
R4-36-401. FM-571 R12-4-903. EXP-757 R20-6-1605. FX#-2448;

Game and Fish Commission R12-4-904. EXP-757 FXN-2448
R12-4-101. PM-1001 R12-4-905. EXP-757 R20-6-1606.  FX#-2448;
R12-4-103. PM-1001 R12-4-906.  EXP-757 FXN-2448
R12-4-104. PM-1001 Health Services, Department of - Health R20-6-1607. FX#-2448;
R12-4-105. PM-1001 Care Institutions: Licensing FXM-2448
R12-4-106. PM-1001 R9-10-119. EN-1787 R20-6-1608.  FX#-2448;
R12-4-107. PM-1001 Health Services, Department of - Health FXM-2448
R12-4-108. PM-1001 Programs Services R20-6-1609. FX#-2448;
R12-4-110. PM-1001 R9-13-201. FXM-1083 FXM-2448
R12-4-111. PM-1001 R9-13-202. FXM-1083 R20-6-1610. FX#-2448
R12-4-112. PM-1001 R9-13-203. FXM-1083 R20-6-1611. FX#-2448;
R12-4-113. PM-1001 R9-13-207. FXM-1083 FXM-2448
R12-4-114. PM-1001 Industrial Commission of Arizona R20-6-1612. FX#-2448:
R12-4-115. PM-1001 R20-5-601. PM-2445; FXM-2448
R12-4-116.  PM-1001 PM-2736 Exhibit A.  FXM-2448
R12-4-117. PM-1001 R20-5-602. PM-2445 Exhibit B. FXR-2448;
R12-4-118. PN-1001 R20-5-629. PM-2512 FXN-2448
R12-4-119. PM-1001 R20-5-1301.  PN-2739 Exhibit C. FXN.2448
R12-4-120. PM-1001 R20-5-1302. PN-2739 Exhibit D. FXN-2448
R12-4-121. PM-1001 R20-5-1303. PN-2739

3000 Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



¥

! Indexes

_—

Arizona Administrative REGISTER

Medical Board, Arizona R4-18-203. PM-201; R13-13-105. PM-1461
R4-16-201. FXM-2678 FM-2009 R13-13-106. PM-1461
R4-16-201.1. FXN-2678 R4-18-204. PM-201; R13-13-107. PM-1461
R4-16-202. FXM-2678 FM-2009 R13-13-108. PM-1461
R4-16-203. FXM-2678 R4-18-206. PM-201; Racing Commission, Arizona
R4-16-204. FXR-2678 FM-2009 R19-2-205. FXM-640
R4-16-205. FXM-2678 R4-18-207. PN-201; R19-2-401. FXM-643
R4-16-205.1. FXN-2678 FN-2009 Radiation Regulatory Agency
R4-16-206. FXM-2678 R4-18-208. PN-201; R12-1-102. PM-2357
R4-16-207. FXR-2678 FN-2009 R12-1-303. PM-2357

Table 1. FXM-2678 R4-18-209. PN-201; R12-1-306. PM-2357

Peace Officer Standards Training, FN-2009 R12-1-308. PM-2357

Board, Arizona R4-18-501. PM-201; R12-1-311. PM-2357
R13-4-101. PM-2711 FM-2009 R12-1-313. PM-2357
R13-4-102.  PM-2711 R4-18-502.  PM-201: R12-1-320.  PM-2357
R13-4-103. PM-2711 FM-2009 R12-1-323. PM-2357
R13-4-104.  PM-2711 R4-18-904.  EM-SI: R12-1-418.  PM-2357
R13-4-105. PM-2711 EM-928: R12-1-452. PM-2357
R13-4-106. PM-2711 FM-2009 R12-1-503. PM-2357
R13-4-107. PM-2711 Power Authority, Arizona R12-1-703. PM-2357
R13-4-108. PM-2711 R12-14-602. FR-297 R12-1-1215. FM-289
R13-4-109. PM-2711 R12-14-603. FN-297 Table A. FM-289
R13-4-109.01. PM-2711 R12-14-604.  FN-297 RI12-1-1302.  FM-289;
R13-4-110. PM-2711 R12-14-605.  FN-297 PM-2357
R13-4-111. PM-2711 R12-14-606.  FN-297 RI12-1-1306.  FM-289
R13-4-112. PM-2711 R12-14-607. FN-297 R12-1-1512. PM-2357
R13-4-114. PM-2711 R12-14-608.  FN-297 R12-1-1901.  PN-2357
R13-4-116. PM-2711 RI2-14-609.  FN-297 R12-1-1903.  PN-2357
R13-4-117. PM-2711 R12-14-610. FN-297 R12-1-1905. PN-2357
R13-4-118. PM-2711 RI2-14-611.  FN-297 R12-1-1907.  PN-2357
R13-4-201. PM-2711 R12-14-612.  FN-297 RI12-1-1909.  PN-2357
R13-4-202. PM-2711 R12-14-613. FN-297 R12-1-1911. PN-2357
R13-4-203. PM-2711 R12-14-614. FN-297 R12-1-1921. PN-2357
R13-4-204. PM-2711 R12-14-615. FN-297 R12-1-1923. PN-2357
R13-4-205. PM-2711 R12-14-616. FN-297 R12-1-1925. PN-2357
R13-4-206. PM-2711 RI2-14-617.  FN-297 RI12-1-1927.  PN-2357
R13-4-208. PM-2711 R12-14-618.  FN-297 RI12-1-1929.  PN-2357

Pest Management, Office of R12-14-619. FN-297 R12-1-1931. PN-2357
R4-29-102. FM-451 R12-14-620.  FN-297 R12-1-1933.  PN-2357
R4-29-103. FM-451 R12-14-621.  FN-297 R12-1-1941.  PN-2357
R4-29-202. FM-451 R12-14-622. FN-297 R12-1-1943. PN-2357
R4-29-203. FM-451 R12-14-623. FN-297 R12-1-1945. PN-2357
R4-29-204. FM-451 R12-14-624.  FN-297 R12-1-1947.  PN-2357
R4-29-207. FM-451 R12-14-625.  FN-297 R12-1-1949.  PN-2357
R4-29-208. FM-451 R12-14-626.  FN-297 RI12-1-1951.  PN-2357
R4-29-304. FM-451 R12-14-627.  FN-297 RI12-1-1953.  PN-2357
R4-29-307. FM-451 R12-14-628. FN-297 R12-1-1955. PN-2357
R4-29-308. FM-451 R12-14-629. FN-297 R12-1-1957. PN-2357
R4-29-501. FM-451 R12-14-630.  FN-297 R12-1-1971.  PN-2357
R4-29-503. FM-451 R12-14-631.  FN-297 R12-1-1973.  PN-2357

Physical Therapy, Board of R12-14-632. FN-297 R12-1-1975. PN-2357
R4-24-208. FXM-924 Public Safety, Department of - Con- R12-1-1977. PN-2357
R4-24-313. FXN-924 cealed Weapons Permits R12-1-1979. PN-2357

Phtxyllsﬁcians Medical Board, Naturo- R13-9-302. EXP-795 R12-1-1981.  PN-2357

pathic R13-9-305. EXP-795 R12-1-19101.  PN-2357
R4-18-101. PM-201; R13-9-307. EXP-795 R12-1-19103.  PN-2357

FM-2009 R13-9-308. EXP-795 R12-1-19105.  PN-2357
R4-18-107. PM-201; R13-9-309. EXP-795 R12-1-19107.  PN-2357
FM-2009 R13-9-310. EXP-795 RI12-1-19109.  PN-2357
R4-18-202. PM-201; Public Safety, Department of - School Appendix A.  PN-2357
FM-2009 Buses
November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48 3001



Arizona Administrative REGISTER

Indexes

¥
AL

Radiation Regulatory Agency - Medical R2-8-120. PM-959; R17-5-306. FXN-1096
Radiologic Technology Board of Exam- FM-2515 R17-5-307. FXN-1096
iners R2-8-122. PM-2281 R17-5-308. FXN-1096
R12-2-101. FM-573 R2-8-123. PM-959; R17-5-309. FXN-1096
R12-2-102. FM-573 FM-2515 R17-5-310. FXN-1096
R12-2-104. FR-573; R2-8-126. PM-959; PM- R17-5-311. FXN-1096
FN-573 2281; R17-5-312. FXN-1096
R12-2-201. FR-573; FM-2515 R17-5-313. FXN-1096
FN-573 R2-8-401. PM-959; R17-5-314. FXN-1096
R12-2-202. FR-573; FM-2515 R17-5-315. FXN-1096
FN-573 R2-8-501. PM-959; R17-5-316. FXN-1096
R12-2-203. FR-573; FM-2515 R17-5-317. FXN-1096
FN-573 R2-8-601. PM-959; R17-5-318. FXN-1096
R12-2-204. FR-573; FM-2515 R17-5-319. FXN-1096
FN-573 R2-8-701. PM-959; R17-5-320. FXN-1096
R12-2-205. FR-573; FM-2515 R17-5-321. FXN-1096
FN-573 Revenue, Department of - General R17-5-901. FXN-1825
R12-2-206. FR-573; Administration R17-5-902. FXN-1825
FN-573 R15-10-108. EXP-1197 R17-5-903. FXN-1825
R12-2-207. FR-573; R15-10-109. EXP-1197 R17-5-904. FXN-1825
FN-573 R15-10-118. EXP-1197 R17-5-905. FXN-1825
R12-2-208. FN-573 R15-10-202. EXP-1197 R17-5-906. FXN-1825
R12-2-301. FR-573; R15-10-702. EN-1830 Transportation, Department of - Title,
FN-573 R15-10-703. EN-1830 Registration, and Driver Licenses
R12-2-302. FN-573 R15-10-704. EN-1830 R17-4-401. FXM-1092
R12-2-303. FN-573 R15-10-706. EN-1830 R17-4-404. FXM-1092
R12-2-304. FN-573 Revenue, Department of - Income and Weights and Measures, Department of
R12-2-305. FN-573 Withholding Tax Section R20-2-101. PM-437;
R12-2-401. FR-573; R15-2C-202. EXP-465 FM-1693
FN-573 R15-2C-204.  EXP-465 R20-2-901. PM-437;
R12-2-402. FR-573; Secretary of State, Office of FM-1693
FN-573 R1-1-101. FM-117 R20-2-902. PM-437;
R12-2-403. FR-573; R1-1-103. FM-117 FM-1693
FN-573 R1-1-104. FM-117 R20-2-903. PM-437;
R12-2-404. FR-573; R1-1-105. FM-117 FM-1693
FN-573 R1-1-106. FM-117 R20-2-904. PM-437;
R12-2-405. FR-573; R1-1-107. FM-117 FM-1693
FN-573 R1-1-109. FM-117 R20-2-906. PM-437;
R12-2-406. FR-573; R1-1-110. FM-117 FM-1693
FN-573 RI-1-114. FM-117 R20-2-907. PM-437;
R12-2-501. FR-573 R1-1-202. FM-117 FM-1693
R12-2-502. FR-573 R1-1-205. FM-117 R20-2-908. PM-437
R12-2-503. FR-573 RI-1-211. FM-117 R20-2-909. PM-437;
R12-2-504. FR-573 R1-1-302. FM-117 FM-1693
R12-2-505. FR-573 R1-1-401. FM-117 R20-2-910. PM-437;
R12-2-506. FR-573 RI-1-414. FM-117 FM-1693
R12-2-601. FR-573 R1-1-502. FM-117 R20-2-913. FN-437;
R12-2-602. FR-573 R1-1-801. FR-117; FM-1693
R12-2-603. FR-573 FN-117 R20-2-1001. PN-437;
R12-2-604. FR-573 R1-1-302. FN-117 FN-1693
R12-2-605. FR-573 R1-1-803. FN-117 R20-2-1002. PN-437;
Retirement System Board, State R1-1-1001. FM-117 FN-1693
R2-8-104. PM-959; State Real Estate Department R20-2-1003. PN-437;
FM-2515 R4-28-405. EXP-757 FN-1693
R2-8-115. PM-959; PM- Tran§ploll;tati0n, Department of - Com- R20-2-1004. PN-437;
2281, mercia rograms FN-1693
FM-2515 RI7-5-301. FXM-1096 R20-2-1005.  PN-437;
R2-8-118. PM-959; PM- RI7-5-302. FXM-1096 FN-1693
2281; RI7-5-303. FXN-1096 R20-2-1006.  PN-437;
FM-2515 R17-5-304. FXN-1096 FN-1693
R17-5-305. FXN-1096
3002 Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



e/

¥ Indexes

Arizona Administrative REGISTER

R20-2-1007. PN-437,
FN-1693
R20-2-1008. PN-437;
FN-1693
R20-2-10009. PN-437;
FN-1693
R20-2-1010. PN-437,;
FN-1693

R20-2-1011. PN-437,
FN-1693

R20-2-1012. PN-437,
FN-1693

R20-2-1013. PN-437,
FN-1693

Table 1. PN-437;
FN-1693

OTHER NOTICES AND PUBLIC RECORDS INDEX

Other notices related to rulemakings are listed in the Index by notice type, agency/county and by volume page number.
Agency policy statements and proposed delegation agreements are included in this section of the Index by volume page

number.

Public records, such as Governor Office executive orders, proclamations, declarations and terminations of
emergencies, summaries of Attorney General Opinions, and county notices are also listed in this section of the Index as

published by volume page number.

THIS INDEX INCLUDES OTHER NOTICE ACTIVITY THROUGH ISSUE 47 OF VOLUME 21.

Agency Guidance Documents, Notices
of

Health Services, Department of; pp.
22-23,325-326, 647, 1495, 2417-2420,
2786

Revenue, Department of; pp. 890-
893,2111, 2688

Agency Ombudsman, Notices of

Child Safety, Department of; pp.
466, 1054

Early Childhood Development and
Health Board; p. 25

Game and Fish Commission; p. 142

Health Services, Department of; p.
498

Lottery Commission, State; p. 526

Psychologist Examiners, Board of; p.
25

Public Safety, Department of; p.
1502

Registrar of Contractors; p. 729

County Notices Pursuant to A.R.S. § 49-
1n2

Maricopa County; p. 984, 1273-1302,
1302-1445, 2124-2261

Pima County; pp. 469-471, 852-853

Pinal County; pp. 422, 501-506, 802-
808, 902-906, 1715-1745, 2083-2087,
2925, 2937

Governor’s Office

Executive Order: pp. 26-27, 102-103,
143-144 (E.O. #2012-03); 163-164
(E.O.#2015-01); 216 (E.O. #2015-02);
552-553 (E.O. #2015-03); 760-761
(E.O. #2015-04); 975 (E.O. #2015-05)

Proclamations: pp. 615-621; 652-654;
693-696; 798-801; 847-851; 899-901;
976-983; 1059-1060; 1130-1134;
1203-1207; 1505-1507; 1653-1657;
1709-1714; 1794-1796; 2113; 2115-
2123, 2320-2326, 2479-2487, 2792

Governor’s Regulatory Review Council

Notices of Action Taken: pp. 193,
317, 479-480, 563-564, 771, 951,
1217, 1757-1758, 2100, 2588

Oral Proceeding on Proposed Rulemak-
ing. Notices of
Child Safety, Department of; 1055,
1269, 1649, 1650, 1866
Optometry, Board of; p. 9, 1648

Psychologist Examiners, Board of; p.
1199

Proposed Delegation Agreement,
Notices of

Environmental Quality, Department
of; p. 267-269, 496, 894-895, 1124,
1496-1497, 1836, 2787

Public Information. Notices of

Agriculture, Department of - Live-
stock & Crop Conservation Grant
Program; p. 896

Arizona Health Care Cost Contain-
ment System; p. 727, 840, 1051, 2789

Child Safety, Arizona Department
of; p. 1051, 1267, 1646, 1838

Emergency and Military Affairs,
Department of - Division of Military
Affairs; p. 159, 1267

Environmental Quality, Department
of; pp. 11-20, 77-87

Environmental Quality, Department
of - Pesticides and Water Pollution
Control; p. 687-689

Environmental Quality, Department
of - Water Pollution Control; p. 1126

Environmental Quality, Department
of - Water Quality Control; pp. 327-
360, 840-842, 1838-1865, 2297-2317

Environmental Quality, Department
of - Water Quality Standards; p. 160

Health Services, Department of; pp.
21, 177-179, 241, 361-362, 413, 2421

Health Services, Department of -
Emergency Medical Services; p.
2422

Health Services, Department of -
Health Programs Services; p. 611

Health Services, Department of -
Laboratories; p. 2422

Optometry, Board of; p. 11

Secretary of State, Office of the; p.
160-161

The Deaf and the Hard of Hearing;
p. 1498

Rulemaking Docket Opening, Notices of

Agriculture, Department of - Envi-
ronmental Services Division; p. 2415

Arizona Health Care Cost Contain-
ment System - Administration; p.
839, 1791, 1835

Arizona Health Care Cost Contain-
ment System - Arizona Long-term
Care System; p. 495

Barbers, Board of; p. 889

Board of Dental Examiners, State; p.
524, 1988-1989

November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48

3003



Arizona Administrative REGISTER

Indexes /\?

Contractors, Registrar of; p. 2473

Corporation Commission, Arizona -
Transportation; p. 685

Cosmetology, Board of; p. 1122, 1790

Emergency and Military Affairs,
Department of - Division of Emer-
gency Management; p. 1198

Environmental Quality, Department
of - Safe Drinking Water; p. 2296

Environmental Quality, Department
of - Water Quality Standards; p. 1989

Fire, Building and Life Safety,
Department of; p. 1123

Game and Fish Commission; p. 759,
1049

Health Services, Department of -
Health Care Institutions: Licensing;
p. 2474

Industrial Commission of Arizona; p.
2475,2573, 2785

Insurance, Department of; p. 1494

Lottery Commission, Arizona State;
pp. 972,973

Peace Officer Standards and Train-
ing Board, Arizona; p. 2784

Physicians Medical Board, Naturo-
pathic; p. 215

Public Safety, Department of -
School Buses; p. 646

Radiation Regulatory Agency; p.
2295

Retirement System Board, State; p.
726,931, 1834, 1987, 2109, 2572

The Deaf and the Hard of Hearing,
Commission for; p. 1493

Weights and Measures, Department
of; p. 412

Substantive Policy Statement, Notices of

Agriculture, Department of; p. 2424

Environmental Quality, Department
of; pp. 88-101, 137-139, 162, 307,
591, 612, 690

Financial Institutions, Department
of; p. 1499

Game and Fish Commission; p. 141

Greater Arizona Development Author-
ity; pp. 391-392

Health Services, Department of; pp.
140, 180-182, 242-249, 270-272, 416-
419, 648, 843-844

Insurance, Department of; p. 591-
593, 1500

Nursing, Board of; p. 136

Psychologist Examiners, Board of; p.
24

Revenue, Department of; p. 932-939

State Real Estate, Department of; p.
551, 1501

Technical Registration, Board of; pp.
414-415

Water Infrastructure Finance
Authority; pp. 393-395

Water Resources, Department of; p.
183

3004

Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015



¥

T

{_ Calendar/Deadlines

Arizona Administrative REGISTER

RULE EFFECTIVE DATES CALENDAR

A.R.S. § 41-1032(A), as amended by Laws 2002, Ch. 334, § 8 (effective August 22, 2002), states that a rule generally
becomes effective 60 days after the day it is filed with the Secretary of State’s Office. The following table lists filing dates
and effective dates for rules that follow this provision. Please also check the rulemaking Preamble for effective dates.

January February March April May June
Date Filed | EMeCVe | Date File | EMECVe | pate Filed | EMeCVe | pate Filed | EMCIV | pate Fileg | EMECIVe | pate Fiieq | Effective
1/1 32 2/1 4/2 3/1 4/30 4/1 5/31 51 6/30 6/1 7/31
1/2 3/3 2/2 4/3 3/2 5/1 4/2 6/1 5/2 7/1 6/2 8/1
1/3 3/4 2/3 4/4 3/3 5/2 4/3 6/2 5/3 72 6/3 8/2
1/4 3/5 2/4 4/5 3/4 5/3 4/4 6/3 5/4 7/3 6/4 8/3
1/5 3/6 2/5 4/6 3/5 5/4 4/5 6/4 5/5 7/4 6/5 8/4
1/6 3/7 2/6 4/7 3/6 5/5 4/6 6/5 5/6 7/5 6/6 8/5
1/7 3/8 2/7 4/8 3/7 5/6 4/7 6/6 5/7 7/6 6/7 8/6
1/8 3/9 2/8 4/9 3/8 5/7 4/8 6/7 5/8 7/7 6/8 8/7
1/9 3/10 2/9 4/10 3/9 5/8 4/9 6/8 5/9 7/8 6/9 8/8
1/10 3/11 2/10 4/11 3/10 5/9 4/10 6/9 5/10 7/9 6/10 8/9
1/11 3/12 2/11 4/12 3/11 5/10 4/11 6/10 5/11 7/10 6/11 8/10
1/12 3/13 2/12 4/13 3/12 5/11 4/12 6/11 5/12 7/11 6/12 8/11
1/13 3/14 2/13 4/14 3/13 5/12 4/13 6/12 5/13 7/12 6/13 8/12
1/14 3/15 2/14 4/15 3/14 5/13 4/14 6/13 5/14 7/13 6/14 8/13
1/15 3/16 2/15 4/16 3/15 5/14 4/15 6/14 5/15 7/14 6/15 8/14
1/16 3/17 2/16 4/17 3/16 5/15 4/16 6/15 5/16 7/15 6/16 8/15
1/17 3/18 2/17 4/18 3/17 5/16 4/17 6/16 5/17 7/16 6/17 8/16
1/18 3/19 2/18 4/19 3/18 5/17 4/18 6/17 5/18 717 6/18 8/17
1/19 3/20 2/19 4/20 3/19 5/18 4/19 6/18 5/19 7/18 6/19 8/18
1/20 3/21 2/20 4/21 3/20 5/19 4/20 6/19 5/20 7/19 6/20 8/19
1/21 3/22 2/21 4/22 3/21 5/20 4/21 6/20 5/21 7/20 6/21 8/20
1/22 3/23 2/22 4/23 3/22 5/21 4/22 6/21 5/22 7/21 6/22 8/21
1/23 3/24 2/23 4/24 3/23 5/22 4/23 6/22 5/23 7/22 6/23 8/22
1/24 3/25 2/24 4/25 3/24 5/23 4/24 6/23 5/24 7/23 6/24 8/23
1/25 3/26 2/25 4/26 3/25 5/24 4/25 6/24 5/25 7/24 6/25 8/24
1/26 3/27 2/26 4/27 3/26 5/25 4/26 6/25 5/26 7/25 6/26 8/25
1727 3/28 2/27 4/28 3/27 5/26 4/27 6/26 5/27 7/26 6/27 8/26
1/28 3/29 2/28 4/29 3/28 5/27 4/28 6/27 5/28 7/27 6/28 8/27
1/29 3/30 3/29 5/28 4/29 6/28 5/29 7/28 6/29 8/28
1/30 3/31 3/30 5/29 4/30 6/29 5/30 7/29 6/30 8/29
1/31 4/1 3/31 5/30 5/31 7/30
November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48 3005



Arizona Administrative REGISTER

Calendar/Deadlines /‘?

July August September October November December
Date Filed | EMCe | pate Filed | EMCIVe | pate Filed | EMCIV | pate Fileq | EMCIV | pate Fileg | EfECIVe | pate Fijgg | Efiecive
71 8/30 8/1 9/30 91 10/31 10/1 11/30 11/1 12/31 12/1 1/30
72 8/31 8/2 10/1 9/2 11/1 10/2 12/1 1172 1/1 12/2 1/31
7/3 9/1 8/3 10/2 9/3 11/2 10/3 12/2 11/3 1/2 12/3 2/1
7/4 9/2 8/4 10/3 9/4 11/3 10/4 12/3 11/4 1/3 12/4 2/2
7/5 9/3 8/5 10/4 9/5 11/4 10/5 12/4 11/5 1/4 12/5 2/3
7/6 9/4 8/6 10/5 9/6 11/5 10/6 12/5 11/6 1/5 12/6 2/4
717 9/5 8/7 10/6 9/7 11/6 10/7 12/6 11/7 1/6 12/7 2/5
7/8 9/6 8/8 10/7 9/8 11/7 10/8 12/7 11/8 1/7 12/8 2/6
7/9 9/7 8/9 10/8 9/9 11/8 10/9 12/8 11/9 1/8 12/9 2/7
7/10 9/8 8/10 10/9 9/10 11/9 10/10 12/9 11/10 1/9 12/10 2/8
7/11 9/9 8/11 10/10 9/11 11/10 10/11 12/10 11/11 1/10 12/11 2/9
7/12 9/10 8/12 10/11 9/12 11/11 10/12 12/11 11/12 1/11 12/12 2/10
7/13 9/11 8/13 10/12 9/13 11/12 10/13 12/12 11/13 1/12 12/13 2/11
7/14 9/12 8/14 10/13 9/14 11/13 10/14 12/13 11/14 1/13 12/14 2/12
7/15 9/13 8/15 10/14 9/15 11/14 10/15 12/14 11/15 1/14 12/15 2/13
7/16 9/14 8/16 10/15 9/16 11/15 10/16 12/15 11/16 1/15 12/16 2/14
717 9/15 8/17 10/16 9/17 11/16 10/17 12/16 11/17 1/16 12/17 2/15
7/18 9/16 8/18 10/17 9/18 11/17 10/18 12/17 11/18 1/17 12/18 2/16
7/19 9/17 8/19 10/18 9/19 11/18 10/19 12/18 11/19 1/18 12/19 2/17
7/20 9/18 8/20 10/19 9/20 11/19 10/20 12/19 11/20 1/19 12/20 2/18
7/21 9/19 8/21 10/20 9/21 11/20 10/21 12/20 11/21 1/20 12/21 2/19
7/22 9/20 8/22 10/21 9/22 11/21 10/22 12/21 11/22 1721 12/22 2/20
7/23 9/21 8/23 10/22 9/23 11/22 10/23 12/22 11/23 1/22 12/23 2/21
7/24 9/22 8/24 10/23 9/24 11/23 10/24 12/23 11/24 1/23 12/24 2/22
7/25 9/23 8/25 10/24 9/25 11/24 10/25 12/24 11/25 1/24 12/25 2/23
7/26 9/24 8/26 10/25 9/26 11/25 10/26 12/25 11/26 1/25 12/26 2/24
7/27 9/25 8/27 10/26 9/27 11/26 10/27 12/26 11/27 1/26 12/27 2/25
7/28 9/26 8/28 10/27 9/28 11727 10/28 12/27 11/28 1/27 12/28 2/26
7/29 9/27 8/29 10/28 9/29 11/28 10/29 12/28 11/29 1/28 12/29 2/27
7/30 9/28 8/30 10/29 9/30 11/29 10/30 12/29 11/30 1/29 12/30 2/28
7/31 9/29 8/31 10/30 10/31 12/30 12/31 3/1
3006 Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015




& )
/3\% Calendar/Deadlines Arizona Administrative REGISTER

REGISTER PUBLISHING DEADLINES

The Secretary of State’s Office publishes the Register weekly. There is a three-week turnaround period between a
deadline date and the publication date of the Register. The weekly deadline dates and issue dates are shown below.
Council meetings and Register deadlines do not correlate. Also listed are the earliest dates on which an oral proceeding
can be held on proposed rulemakings or proposed delegation agreements following publication of the notice in the

Register.

Oral Proceeding may be

Deadline Date (paper only) Register
scheduled on or after

Friday, 5:00 p.m. Publication Date

September 4, 2015
September 11, 2015
September 18, 2015
September 25, 2015
October 2, 2015
October 9, 2015
October 16, 2015
October 23, 2015
October 30, 2015
November 6, 2015
November 13, 2015
November 20, 2015
November 27, 2015
December 4, 2015
December 11, 2015
December 18, 2015
December 25, 2015
January 1, 2016
January 8, 2016
January 15, 2016
January 22, 2016
January 29, 2016
February 5, 2016
February 12, 2016
February 19, 2016
February 26, 2016
March 4, 2016
March 11, 2016
March 18, 2016

September 25, 2015
October 2, 2015
October 9, 2015
October 16, 2015
October 23, 2015
October 30, 2015

November 6, 2015
November 13, 2015
November 20, 2015
November 27, 2015
December 4, 2015
December 11, 2015
December 18, 2015
December 25, 2015
January 1, 2016
January 8§, 2016
January 15, 2016
January 22, 2016
January 29, 2016
February 5, 2016
February 12,2016
February 19, 2016
February 26, 2016
March 4, 2016
March 11, 2016
March 18, 2016
March 25, 2016
April 1,2016
April 8,2016

October 26, 2015
November 2, 2015
November 9, 2015
November 16, 2015
November 23, 2015
November 30, 2015

December 7, 2015
December 14, 2015
December 21, 2015

December 28, 2015

January 4, 2016
January 11, 2016
January 18, 2016
January 25, 2016
February 1, 2016
February 8, 2016
February 15, 2016
February 22, 2016
February 29, 2016
March 7, 2016
March 14, 2016
March 21, 2016
March 28, 2016
April 4,2016
April 11, 2016
April 18,2016
April 25,2016
May 2, 2016
May 9, 2016

November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48

3007



¥
A

=

GR.R.C. Deadlines

Arizona Administrative REGISTER

GOVERNOR’S REGULATORY REVIEW COUNCIL
DEADLINES

The following deadlines apply to all Five-Year-Review

Reports and any adopted rule submitted to the Governor’s
Regulatory Review Council.
Register deadlines do not correlate. We publish these
deadlines as a courtesy.

Council meetings and

All rules and Five-Year Review Reports are due in the
Council office by 5:00 p.m. of the deadline date. The
Council’s office is located at 100 N. 15th Ave., Suite 402,
Phoenix, AZ 85007. For more information, call (602) 542-

2058 or visit www.grrc.state.az.us.

DEADLINE TO BE
PLACED ON COUNCIL
AGENDA

FINAL MATERIALS
DUE FROM
AGENCIES

DATE OF COUNCIL
STUDY SESSION

DATE OF COUNCIL
MEETING

November 17,2014

December 17, 2014

December 30, 2014

January 6, 2015

December 15, 2014

January 14, 2015

January 27,2015

February 3, 2015

January 20, 2015

February 11, 2015

February 24, 2015

March 3, 2015

February 17, 2015

March 18, 2015

March 31, 2015

April 7, 2015

March 16, 2015 April 15, 2015 April 28, 2015 May 5, 2015
April 20, 2015 May 13, 2015 May 28, 2015 June 2, 2015
May 18, 2015 June 17, 2015 June 30, 2015 July 7, 2015

June 15, 2015

July 15, 2015

July 28, 2015

August 4, 2015

July 20, 2015

August 12, 2015

August 25, 2015

September 1, 2015

August 17,2015

September 16, 2015

September 29, 2015

October 6, 2015

September 21, 2015

October 14, 2015

October 27, 2015

November 3, 2015

October 19, 2015

November 12, 2015

November 24, 2015

December 1, 2015

November 16, 2015

December 16, 2015

December 29, 2015

January 5, 2016

3008

Vol. 21, Issue 48 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | November 27, 2015




. e
Arizona Administrative REGISTER GRR.C Deadlines _{_

GOVERNOR'S REGULATORY REVIEW COUNCIL
NOTICE OF ACTION TAKEN AT THE
NOVEMBER 3, 2015 MEETING
[M15-291]
FIVE-YEAR-REVIEW REPORTS:
ARIZONA DEPARTMENT OF INSURANCE (F-15-0903)
Title 20, Chapter 6, Article 4, Types of Insurance Companies; Article 5, The Insurance Contract; Article 6, Types of Insur-
ance Contracts; Article 19, Health Care Services Organizations Oversight

ARIZONA BOARD OF CHIROPRACTIC EXAMINERS (F-15-1101)

Title 4, Chapter 7, Article 1, Definitions; Meetings; Article 2, Committees; Article 3, Hearings; Article 4, Examinations;
Article 5, Licenses; Article 6, Acupuncture Certification; Article 7, Standards of Education; Article 8, Continuing Educa-
tion; Article 9, Unprofessional Conduct; Article 10, Preceptorship Training Program; Article 11, Chiropractic Assistants;
Article 13, Charges; Article 14, Business Entities

ARIZONA RADIATION REGULATORY AGENCY (F-15-1102)
Title 12, Chapter 1, Article 6, Use of X-rays in the Healing Arts; Article 12, Administrative Provisions; Article 14, Registra-
tion of Nonionizing Radiation Sources and Standards for Protection Against Nonionizing Radiation

ARIZONA DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH SERVICES (F-15-1103)
Title 9, Chapter 11, All Articles

RULES:

ARIZONA BOARD OF DENTAL EXAMINERS (R-15-1101)

Title 4, Chapter 11, Article 17, Rehearing or Review

Amend: R4-11-1701

ARIZONA DEPARTMENT OF EMERGENCY AND MILITARY AFFAIRS (R-15-1102)
Title 8, Chapter 2, Article 1, Search or Rescue
Amend: R8-2-101; R8-2-102; R8-2-103; R8-2-104; R8-2-105

ARIZONA GAME AND FISH DEPARTMENT (R-15-1103)

Title 12, Chapter 4, Article 1, Definitions and General Provisions; Article 3, Taking and Handling of Wildlife; Article 6,

Rules of Practice Before the Commission; Article 8, Wildlife Areas and Department Property

Renumber: R12-4-125, R12-4-804

Amend: R12-4-101, R12-4-103, R12-4-104, R12-4-105, R12-4-106, R12-4-107, R12-4-108, R12-4-110,
R12-4-111,R12-4-112, R12-4-113, R12-4-114, R12-4-115, R12-4-116, R12-4-117, R12-4-119,
R12-4-120, R12-4-121, R12-4-125, R12-4-302, R12-4-611

New Sections: R12-4-118, R12-4-124

ARIZONA DEPARTMENT OF FIRE, BUILDING AND LIFE SAFETY (R-15-1104)
Title 4, Chapter 36, Article 2, Arizona State Fire Code; Article 3, International Fire Code Modifications

Amend: R4-36-201; R4-36-301; R4-36-302; R4-36-303; R4-36-304
R4-36-305; R4-36-307; R4-36-308; R4-36-309; R4-36-310
Repeal: R4-36-311

ARIZONA DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY (R-15-1105)

Title 13, Chapter 13, Article 1, School Bus Minimum Standards

Amend: R13-13-105, R13-13-106, R13-13-107, R13-13-108

COUNCIL ACTION: ALL OF THE ABOVE ITEMS WERE APPROVED ON THE CONSENT AGENDA

November 27, 2015 | Published by the Arizona Secretary of State | Vol. 21, Issue 48 3009



	01_contents
	02_information
	03_guide
	06_final
	13_final_exempt
	19_docket
	21_proposed_delegation_agreements
	23_substantive_policy_statements
	24_agency_ombudsman
	26_governor_EO
	27_governor_proclamations
	29_indexes
	30_calendar_deadlines
	31_GRRC

